EzLyna (LKKAuto)

From: Elise Law <eliselaw@successunited.com.sg>

Sent: Friday, 4 August 2023 11:53 am

To: EzLyna (LKKAuto)

Cc: Admin A

Subject: Re: TP - SKF9818L | SCQ1868G | DoA 22/07/2023 | Your Ref: SCQ1868G - AIG *** LKK

REF: CC6/AIG23007653/Aya3

Hi EzLyna,
Thanks for your screenshot photos.

We inform our client and convert it to OD claim.

Thank you.
Best Regards,

Elise Law
Claim Executive

SUCCESS UNITED PTE LTD

2 Kaki Bukit Ave 2

#01-33 Kaki Bukit AutoHub
Singapore 417921

Tel: 6746 1515 Fax: 6748 5015

On Fri, 4 Aug 2023 at 11:21, EzLyna (LKKAuto) <ezlyna@lkkauto.com> wrote:

Without Prejudice

Dear Elise,

We refer to your email below.

Pls find enclosed herewith screen shot from our OlI’s VF.



Kindly advise your client to convert to OD claim. Thank you.

With warmest regards,

Ezlyna

From: Elise Law <eliselaw@successunited.com.sg>

Sent: Tuesday, August 1, 2023 9:18 AM

To: EzLyna (LKKAuto) <ezlyna@Ikkauto.com>

Cc: WEI NI TAN <wynni@successunited.com.sg>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; Mei Kwan (LKKAuto)
<Meikwan@Ikkauto.com>

Subject: Re: TP - SKF9818L | SCQ1868G | DoA 22/07/2023 | Your Ref: SCQ1868G - AIG *** LKK REF:
CC6/A1G23007653/Aya3

Hi EzLyna,

Our client doesn't have any video footage.

Do you insured had any video footage?



So, | can use the video footage to prove that my client had run the red light.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Elise Law

Claim Executive

SUCCESS UNITED PTE LTD
2 Kaki Bukit Ave 2

#01-33 Kaki Bukit AutoHub
Singapore 417921

Tel: 6746 1515 Fax: 6748 5015

On Mon, 31 Jul 2023 at 18:56, Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) <Meikwan@Ikkauto.com> wrote:

Dear Sir / Madam,
We refer to the above matter.

Please be informed that OI has reported. Please refer to the below OI’s sketch plan and statement.
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Please provide us the following.
. evidence i.e. video and scene photo (if any)
. PIR result (if any)

Please note that for liability, claim negotiation and settlement, please contact Lyna.

To check availability of the case handler, you may contact the undersigned.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Mei Kwan | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6366 0055 | email: MeiKwan@lkkauto.com




Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Elise Law <eliselaw@successunited.com.sg>

Sent: Friday, July 28, 2023 1:24 PM

To: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>

Cc: WEI NI TAN <wynni@successunited.com.sg>

Subject: TP - SKF9818L | SCQ1868G | DoA 22/07/2023 | Your Ref: SCQ1868G - AIG

Hi,

Kindly advise on the liability of this case.

Encloed the GIA report for your reference.

FYI, Adrian just survey our client vehicle (SKF9818L).

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Elise Law

Claim Executive

SUCCESS UNITED PTE LTD
2 Kaki Bukit Ave 2

#01-33 Kaki Bukit AutoHub
Singapore 417921

Tel: 6746 1515 Fax: 6748 5015



