Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

From:

Sent:

To:

Cc:

Subject:
Attachments:

Dear Sirs,

We refer to the above matter.

Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)
Monday, 31 July 2023 3:55 PM
EE_Guo_Yong@ica.gov.sg

HAN_Shun_Chou@ica.gov.sg; CHIAM_Yong_Kiang@ica.gov.sg; Olivia Lau (LKKAuto)

[SEEK APPROVAL TO OFFER] - Claim from third party - PC8050Y
TP LOD _ CLAIM DOCS.pdf; LKK SURVEY REPORT.pdf

The incident happened when gantry barrier hit onto civilian vehicle.

Basing on the reports of the circumstance of the accident, we propose to settle third-party claim at 100% liability.

We seek your approval to offer law firm "CROSSBOWS LLP" at $3,796.00(all-in).

The summary is as follows: -

Amount Claimed

Amount Revised

1. Cost of Repair (WITH GST) $ 3,424.00 $ 2,568.00 ($2,400.00 + 7%GST)
2. Loss of Use (4days x $150.00) $  600.00 $  450.00 (3DAYS X $150.00)
3. SURVEY REPORT FEE $  378.00 $ 378.00
4. LEGAL COSTS $  500.00 $  400.00
5. FACSIMILE, POSTAGE, PHOTOSCOPY & | $  20.00 -
OTHER INCIDENTALS.

Total | $ 4,922.00 $ 3,796.00

Enclosed here with all the relevant documents for your perusal.

Kindly let us have your approval to offer to CIVILIAN.

Thank You.

Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742-3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com |

HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 |

S(408933)

From: Guo Yong EE (ICA) <EE_Guo_Yong@ica.gov.sg>
Sent: Thursday, July 27, 2023 4:07 PM
To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>




Cc: Shun Chou Jason HAN (ICA) <HAN_Shun_Chou@ica.gov.sg>; Yong Kiang CHIAM (ICA)
<CHIAM_Yong_Kiang@ica.gov.sg>; Olivia Lau (LKKAuto) <olivialau@Ilkkauto.com>
Subject: RE: Claim from third party - PC8050V

Message Classification: Restricted
Hsiao Tong

As conversed, the third party contact is as follow:

Re: Your reference : ML.acc.9137.22 - Claim for Damage to PC8050Y

@ Michael =michael@crossbows.com.sg=

To Guo Yong EE (ICA)

Cc @ Shun Chou Jason HAM (ICA); © Kartika Sari ZAHRI (ICA)

l This i5 an Intemet email. If you are unsure of the content, please check the sounce before you respond.

Dear 5ir
Please do reply to our email of 18.04.2023 within the next 7 days i.e. by 29.07.2023

Yours truly
(Michael Low)

Crossbhows LLP

14 Robinson Road

#07-02A, Far East Finance Building
Singapore 04E545

Tel:{s85]} 6552 9380

Michael's Direct Line: 6797 2202
Michael's Whatsapp: 96633208

Ee Guo Yong
| *r%qlll ﬁr—ﬁ '+ Senior Executive (Infra Planning and Services)
ICA20 Logistics, Infrastructure and Finance Div
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From: Guo Yong EE (ICA)
Sent: Monday, July 24, 2023 1:56 PM



To: 'chewht@lkkauto.com' <chewht@Ikkauto.com>

Cc: Shun Chou Jason HAN (ICA) <HAN Shun Chou@ica.gov.sg>; Yong Kiang CHIAM (ICA)
<CHIAM Yong Kiang@ica.gov.sg>; Olivia Lau (LKKAuto) <olivialau@I|kkauto.com>
Subject: RE: Claim from third party - PC8050V

Message Classification: Restricted

Hsiao Tong
The third party had sent a reminder on the claim.
Have you get in touch with them?

Thanks.

From: Guo Yong EE (ICA)

Sent: Wednesday, August 17, 2022 4:23 PM

To: 'chewht@lkkauto.com' <chewht@Ikkauto.com>

Cc: Shun Chou Jason HAN (ICA) <HAN Shun Chou®@ica.gov.sg>; Yong Kiang CHIAM (ICA)
<CHIAM Yong Kiang@ica.gov.sg>

Subject: RE: Claim from third party - PC8050V

Message Classification: Restricted

Hsiao Tong

Video Footage attached.
Thanks.

Ee Guo Yong

Senior Executive (Infrastructure Planning & Services)
Logistics, Infrastructure & Finance Division (LIFD)
DID: (65) 6391 6566
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From: Guo Yong EE (ICA)

Sent: Wednesday, 17 August 2022 4:21 PM

To: 'chewht@lkkauto.com' <chewht@Ikkauto.com>

Cc: Shun Chou Jason HAN (ICA) <HAN_ Shun Chou®@ica.gov.sg>; Yong Kiang CHIAM (ICA)

3



<CHIAM Yong Kiang@ica.gov.sg>
Subject: Claim from third party - PC8050V

Message Classification: Restricted

Hsiao Tong

Pls assist with the attached claim.
Due to size of the email, will forward the video footage by the claimant through second email.
Thanks.

Ee Guo Yong

Senior Executive (Infrastructure Planning & Services)
Logistics, Infrastructure & Finance Division (LIFD)
DID: (65) 6391 6566
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