Mei Kwan (LKKAuto)

From: Rajes (LKK Auto)

Sent: Monday, 24 July 2023 3:38 PM

To: Motor Claims (Allianz Insurance Singapore); Admin A

Cc: assignments

Subject: RE: PRE-REPAIR INSPECTION FOR SNG6994P, Your INSUR SJY9032Z .
Categories: HMK

Dear Shantj,

Thank you for the assignment.

Best Regards,
Rajes | Admin
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6741-8434 | email: assighments@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315 Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1,
#02-25 | S(408933)

From: Motor Claims (Allianz Insurance Singapore) <claims@allianz.com.sg>

Sent: Monday, July 24, 2023 2:16 PM

To: GOLD AUTOWORKS PTE LTD <claims@goldautoworks.com.sg>; Admin A <admin-a@Ilkkauto.com>
Cc: admin-d <admin-d@lkkauto.com>

Subject: FW: PRE-REPAIR INSPECTION FOR SNG6994P, Your INSUR SJY9032Z .

Internal



Your ref: SNG6994P

Our ref: 2023 32010942JK-SJY90327

Dear Sirs,

We hereby appoint our direct settlement partners LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD to conduct survey.

Kindly engage with them to arrange for survey.

WINSTON @ 98719488

GOLD AUTOWORKS PTE. LTD.

48 TOH GUAN ROADS ENTERPRISE HUB, #01-119 SINGAPORE 608586
(TEL) 62640995 (FAX) 62645948

(Email) claims@goldautoworks.com.sg  (Website)

https://goldautoworks.com.sg/

File: SJY9032Z Ol.pdf

Link: https://filexchange.allianz.de/SecureDownload.aspx?id=5a616bab-64b9-4131-a2a4-047194cf8bcd-
5ea7cbe597bf0d09

Size: ~ 0 MByte, Download available until: 7/29/2023

Thank you.



Best regards,

Shanti. R

Claims Service

Allianz Insurance Singapore Pte. Ltd. | UEN 201903913C
79 Robinson Road #09-01 | Singapore 068897

Phone: +65 6395 3836 | www.allianz.sg

This e-mail and any files transmitted with it is intended only for the named recipients and may contain confidential
and/

or privileged information. If you are not the intended recipient, please do not read, copy, use or disclose the contents
of

this communication to others and notify the sender immediately. Then please delete the e-mail and any copies of it.

Thank you.

P Please consider the environment before printing this e-mail.

From: GOLD AUTOWORKS PTE LTD <claims@goldautoworks.com.sg>
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Sent: Monday, 24 July 2023 11:21 am

To: Motor Claims (Allianz Insurance Singapore) <claims@allianz.com.sg>

Subject: [EXT] PRE-REPAIR INSPECTION FOR SNG6994P, Your INSUR SJY9032Z .

Dear Sir/Madam,

Accident involving SNG6994P AND SJY9032Z at NEAR TUAS WEST ROAD, PIONEER ROAD TOWARDS TUAS WEST ROAD
on 19/07/2023 11:15 HRS

1. We are here to notify you of a road traffic accident on 11/07/2023

11:15 at NEAR TUAS WEST ROAD, PIONEER ROAD TOWARDS TUAS WEST ROAD

involving our client vehicle registration number SNG6994P and vehicle registration number SJY9032Z driven by your
insure

at the material time and date.

2. As a result of the accident, our client vehicle SNG6994P has been damaged. Please arrange and conduct a PRE- REPAIR
SURVEY

for our client vehicle on 24/07/2023 or within 2 day from this email.

3. Please arrange a PRE-REPAIR SURVEY at 48,TOH GUAN RD EAST, ENTERPRISE HUB #01-119 S(608586)

Best Regards,



WINSTON

98719488

GOLD AUTOWORKS PTE. LTD.

48 TOH GUAN ROADS ENTERPRISE HUB, #01-119 SINGAPORE 608586
(TEL) 62640995 (FAX) 62645948

(Email) claims@goldautoworks.com.sg  (Website)

https://goldautoworks.com.sg/

*STRICTLY CONFIDENTIAL*

This message, its contents and any files transmitted with it are intended SOLELY for the addressee(s) and may be legally
privileged and/or confidential. Access by any other party is unauthorised without the express written permission of the
sender. If you have received this message in error, you may not copy or use the contents, attachments or information in
any way. Please destroy it and contact us immediately via e-mail return. This message has been prepared using
information believed by the author to be reliable and accurate; we make no warranty as to its accuracy or completeness.
We do not accept responsibility for changes made to this message after it was sent.
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**WARNING: Computer viruses can and/or may be transmitted via email.

Kindly check and ensure that all emails received from our firm ends with the domain @goldautoworks.com.sg before
acting on them. When and/or if unsure, please contact us to verify. Please note that the company accepts no liability for
any damage caused by any virus transmitted by this email.



