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Mei Kwan (LKKAuto)

From: Rajes (LKK Auto)
Sent: Thursday, 20 July 2023 12:18 PM
To: Motor Claims (Allianz Insurance Singapore); Admin A
Cc: assignments
Subject: RE: Re: 3rd party claim vehicle SML9515E request surveyor appointment, DOA: 

13/07/2023 Your insured: GBF8245C

Categories: HMK

Dear ShanƟ,  
 
 
Thank you for the assignment. 
 
 
Best Regards, 

Rajes | Admin  

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6741-8434 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com  | fax: 6256-4315 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 
 

From: Motor Claims (Allianz Insurance Singapore) <claims@allianz.com.sg>  
Sent: Thursday, July 20, 2023 12:15 PM 
To: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com> 
Cc: admin-d <admin-d@lkkauto.com>; Grace Tan <Grace@Ricardo.com.sg> 
Subject: FW: Re: 3rd party claim vehicle SML9515E request surveyor appointment, DOA: 13/07/2023 Your insured: 
GBF8245C 
 

Internal 
 
Your ref:  SML9515E 
Our ref:  2023 32010721FR-GBF8245C 
  
  
Dear Sirs,  
  
We hereby appoint our direct settlement partners   LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD   to conduct survey. 
  
Kindly engage with them to arrange for survey.  
  
Grace Tan 
Ricardo Auto Centre Pte Ltd  
160 Sin Ming Drive #02-02/03  
Sin Ming AutoCity , Singapore 575722  
  
T: 6475 2112 (Main)  6460 9542 (DID 
 
File: GBF8245C-OI.pdf 
Link: https://filexchange.allianz.de/SecureDownload.aspx?id=3586987c-b2ed-4fbd-8faf-65e0d3b8caff-c1c6bc33d0d1a813 
Size: ~ 1 MByte, Download available until: 7/25/2023 
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Thank you.  
  
Best regards, 
  
  
   Shanti. R 
   Claims Service  
   Allianz Insurance Singapore Pte. Ltd. | UEN 201903913C 
   79 Robinson Road #09-01 I Singapore 068897 
   Phone: +65 6395 3836 | www.allianz.sg 
  
    

 
  
  
    This e-mail and any files transmitted with it is intended only for the named recipients and may contain confidential and /   
    or privileged information. If you are not the intended recipient, please do not read, copy, use or disclose the contents of  
    this communication to others and notify the sender immediately. Then please delete the e-mail and any copies of it.    
    Thank you. 
  
Please consider the environment before printing this e-mail. 
 

From: Grace Tan <Grace@Ricardo.com.sg>  
Sent: Tuesday, 18 July 2023 2:47 pm 
To: customerservice@allianz.com.sg 
Subject: [EXT] Re: 3rd party claim vehicle SML9515E request surveyor appointment, DOA: 13/07/2023 Your insured: 
GBF8245C 
 
Dear Sirs, 
 
Re: Accident involving SML9515E & GBF8245C on 13/07/2023 along Boon Lay Way 
 
We are instructed by owner of SML9515E to file 3rd party claim against GBF8245C according to GIA search is insured 
with Allianz Insurance. 
AƩached SML9515E repair quotaƟon, GIA report for your perusal. 
Kindly arrange surveyor to survey SML9515E at below address without any delay. (vehicle cannot drive now) 
Please let us know the liability status soonest possible.  
Thanks.  
 
Kind Regards,  
   
Grace Tan 
Ricardo Auto Centre Pte Ltd  
   
160 Sin Ming Drive #02-02/03  
Sin Ming AutoCity  
Singapore 575722  
  
T: 6475 2112 (Main)  
    6460 9542 (DID)  
F: 6475 4666  
W: www.ricardo.com.sg  
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Save Paper. Save the Earth. Think twice before you print.  

Disclaimer: The information contained in this email and/or its attachment(s) is provided to you for information only and is not intended to or nor will it 
create/induce the creation of any binding legal relations. Ricardo  and/or any of its members will not, in any event, be liable to you for any direct/indirect 
or any other damages of any kind arising from or in connection with your reliance on any information in and/or materials attached to this email. The 
information and/or materials are provided “as is” without warranty of any kind, either express or implied. In particular, no warranty regarding accuracy or 
fitness for a purpose is given in connection with such information and materials. 
  
Confidentiality Note: This e-mail and its attachment(s) may contain privileged or confidential information which is intended only for the use of the 
recipient(s) named above. If you have received this message in error, please notify the sender immediately and delete all copies of it. If you are not the 
intended recipient, you must not read, use, copy, store, disseminate and/or disclose to any person this email and any of its attachment(s). Ricardo 
and/or its members will not accept legal responsibility for the contents of this message. Thank you for your cooperation. 
 


