Meng Yan (LKK Auto)

From: Claims <claims@budgetdirect.com.sg>

Sent: Thursday, 20 July 2023 12:05 pm

To: admin-d; SUR; assignments

Cc: Derrick Quok; Kenneth Lim; Don Bong; Ng Chen How

Subject: TPPD survey: Claim ref: C10023508 /CH || Ol- SJF6100E (Purple) TP-SMH9003L || Est: $0.00 || My Car Consultant PL
Attachments: C10023508 - TP (SMH9003L).zip

Hi Team,

We would like to request TP survey for SMH9003L. TP chose LKK to survey the vehicle.

Workshop information:
Address:

Jackson Ho
Claim Handler | Motor Claims Department

My Car Consultant Pte Lid
M: 8344 7681 | F: 6925 5219
W: Mycar.sg | E: admin@mycar.sg

Lo Toalawm T aneve TTeamd MNrnomenn nembems Do aa O

Please confirm assignment.
Thank you.
Warmest Regards,

Frauleine Khoo
Admin Executive, Claims

T +65 6989 3696
F +65 6725 0853
E frauleine.khoo@budgetdirect.com.sg
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From: Jackson <admin@mycar.sg>

Sent: Thursday, July 20, 2023 11:26 AM

To: Claims <claims@budgetdirect.com.sg>

Subject: PRI Request on 18.07.2023 || C10023508/CH || OUR REF: SMH9003L YOUR REF: SJF6100E PRE REPAIR INSPECTION FOR SMH9003L

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Dear Sirs,

We would like to choose Kenneth from Lkk for survey.

Best Regards,



Jackson Ho
Claim Handler | Motor Claims Department

My Car Consultant Pte Ltd

M: 8344 7681 | F: 6925 5219

W: Mycar.sg | E: admin@mycar.sg

60 Jalan Lam Huat, Carros Centre #05-21 S(737869)
UEN No.: 2016058787

From: Jackson <admin@mycar.sg>
Sent: Monday, July 17, 2023 5:38 PM

To: Claims <claims@budgetdirect.com.sg>
Subject: OUR REF: SMH9003L YOUR REF: SJF6100E PRE REPAIR INSPECTION FOR SMH9003L

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

* *Survey location: 60 Jalan Lam Huat, Carros Centre #05-68
OUR REF: SMH9oo03L

YOUR REF: SJF6100E

Dear Sir/Madam,
PRE-REPAIR INSPECTION FOR SMH9003L
ACCIDENT INVOLVING SMH9003L AND SJF6100E

We refer to the above matter and enclosed herewith our client's GIA report and Notification of Pre-repair inspection for your attention.

Best Regards,

Jackson Ho



Claim Handler | Motor Claims Department

My Car Consultant Pte Ltd
M: 8344 7681 | F: 6925 5219
W: Mycar.sg | E: admin@mycar.sg

60 Jalan Lam Huat, Carros Centre #05-21 S(737869)
UEN No.: 2016058787



