Mei Kwan (LKKAuto)

From: June Phua ( Cheng Hoe Motor) <chmotor@singnet.com.sg>

Sent: Friday, 14 July 2023 5:16 PM

To: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto)

Subject: Re: ENQUIRY OF LIABILITY - SJU5571G (DOA: 12/07/2023) - AIG INSURED : SKQ6333E
Attachments: INCOME TP.pdf

Follow Up Flag: Follow up

Flag Status: Flagged

Categories: HMK

Hi MeikKwan,

Sorry for late reply.
Pls see attachment

Thank you.

Rgds

June

Cheng Hoe Motor Pte Ltd

Tel : 67556142

Fax : 67557719

Email- chmotor@singnet.com.sg

From: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto)

Sent: Thursday, July 13, 2023 8:26 PM

To: Dorlyn Li (Cheng Hoe)

Subject: RE: ENQUIRY OF LIABILITY - SJU5571G (DOA: 12/07/2023) - AIG INSURED : SKQ6333E

Dear Sir / Madam,
Thank you for your email.

Please send us full set GIA report.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Mei Kwan | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6366 0055 | email: MeiKwan@lkkauto.com

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Dorlyn Li (Cheng Hoe) <chmotor@singnet.com.sg>
Sent: Thursday, July 13,2023 7:17 PM



To: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) <Meikwan@Ikkauto.com>; Weilin (Cheng Hoe) <chmotor@singnet.com.sg>
Subject: ENQUIRY OF LIABILITY - SJU5571G (DOA: 12/07/2023) - AlG INSURED : SKQ6333E

Dear Sir/Madam,

OUR CLIENT - SJU5571G
DOA: 12/7/23 @ 1905hr
AIG INSURED : SKQ6333E

Attached our client report.

Pls advise on liability and any instruction for DIRECT SETTLEMENT?

Thank you.

Rgds,

Dorlyn Li

Cheng Hoe Motor Pte Ltd
Tel :67556142

Fax : 67557719



