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Meng Yan (LKK Auto)

From: Claims <claims@budgetdirect.com.sg>
Sent: Friday, 14 July 2023 1:08 pm
To: admin-d; SUR; assignments
Cc: Derrick Quok; Kenneth Lim; Don Bong; Teo Jie Yang
Subject: TPPD PRS: Claim ref: C10023458 /JY || OI- SJQ2774D (Silver) TP-SME7320A || Est: $0.00 || M/S 2020 Spray Painting PL
Attachments: C10023458 - TP (SME7320A).zip

Hi Team,  
 
We would like to request TP PRS for SME7320A.  TP chose LKK to survey the vehicle. 
 
Workshop information:  
Address:        

 
 
Please confirm assignment.   
 
Thank you. 
 
Warmest Regards, 
 
Frauleine Khoo 
Admin Executive, Claims 
 
 
T +65 6989 3696 
F +65 6725 0853   
E frauleine.khoo@budgetdirect.com.sg 
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Customer Care +65 6221 2111 
Claims +65 6221 2199 
Claims (Int.) +65 6540 2199 
 
190 Clemenceau Avenue, #03-01 
Singapore Shopping Centre 
Singapore 239924                                                                                                                                  
budgetdirect.com.sg 
 

 
 
Auto & General Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Limited (Co. Reg. No. 201626103G) trading as Budget Direct Insurance. 
 
This email is sent by Auto & General (SEA) Services Pte. Limited or a related body corporate (Auto & General) and is for the intended 
addressee. The views expressed in this email and attachments (email) reflect the views of the stated author but may not reflect views of Auto 
& General. This email is confidential and subject to copyright. It may be privileged. If you are not the intended addressee, confidentiality and 
privilege have not been waived and any use, interference with, or disclosure of this email is unauthorised.  

 
 
 

From: cindy.tan@kannansg.com.sg <cindy.tan@kannansg.com.sg>  
Sent: Friday, July 14, 2023 12:58 PM 
To: Claims <claims@budgetdirect.com.sg> 
Subject: RE: PRS Request on 14.07.2023 || C10023458/JY || Yref: SJQ 2774D Oref: KSG/5852/2023/L/ct  
 
 
Dear Sirs                                                                WITHOUT PREJUDICE  
 
RE:        PROPERTY DAMAGE CLAIM 
             CLAIMANT : LEE SHENG YE, LAWSON (NRIC NO. SXXXX463I) 

ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLES NO. SME 7320A & SJQ 2774D ALONG KALLANG PAYA LEBAR EXPRESSWAY ON 12 JULY 2023 AT 1930 HRS     
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We refer to the above maƩer and to your email of even date.  
 
We are instructed to propose using LKK as the single joint expert as listed in your said email. 
 
Kindly contact Shah - 9716 6502 to arrange for the pre-repair inspecƟon soonest possible.  
 
 
Regards 
 
Cindy Tan  
On behalf of Mr Kannan 
 
M/S KANNAN SG 
Advocates & solicitors  
50 Chin Swee Road  
#08-03 Thong Chai Building 
Singapore 169874 
 
TEL:  (+65) 6429 0253 
FAX: (+65) 6223 1660 
 
**********************************************************************************************************************************************
*********************************** 
 
IMPORTANT: THIS E-MAIL IS INTENDED ONLY FOR THE USE OF THE ADDRESSEE AND MAY CONTAIN CONFIDENTIAL 
INFORMATION AND/OR MAY BE COVERED BY PROFESSIONAL PRIVILEGE. IT MUST NOT BE READ, USED OR DISCLOSED BY ANY 
PERSON OTHER THAN THE ADDRESSEE(S) NAMED. IF YOU HAVE RECEIVED THIS E-MAIL IN ERROR, PLEASE NOTIFY US 
IMMEDIATELY BY TELEPHONE (COLLECT INTERNATIONAL CALL IF APPROPRIATE) AT (+65) 6429 0252 OR BY E-MAIL AND 
DELETE THE E-MAIL IMMEDIATELY. THANK YOU. 
 
**********************************************************************************************************************************************
*********************************** 
 
 

From: cindy.tan@kannansg.com.sg <cindy.tan@kannansg.com.sg>  
Sent: Friday, July 14, 2023 12:13 PM 
To: Claims <claims@budgetdirect.com.sg> 
Subject: Yref: SJQ 2774D Oref: KSG/5852/2023/L/ct  
 
Dear Sirs                                                                WITHOUT PREJUDICE  
 
RE:        PROPERTY DAMAGE CLAIM 
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             CLAIMANT : LEE SHENG YE, LAWSON (NRIC NO. SXXXX463I) 
ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLES NO. SME 7320A & SJQ 2774D ALONG KALLANG PAYA LEBAR EXPRESSWAY ON 12 JULY 2023 AT 1930 HRS     
    

We act for Mr Lee Sheng Ye, Lawson, the owner of motor vehicle No. SME7320A, which was involved in the aforesaid accident. A copy of the Singapore Accident 
Statement filed is enclosed.  
 
As a result of the accident, our client’s vehicle has been damaged. Before our client proceed to repair the damaged vehicle, please let us know within 2 working 
days of your receipt of this noƟce whether you would like to conduct a pre-repair survey of the vehicle at our client’s workshop. The details are as follows:- 
 
Place:                    M/s 2020 Spray PainƟng Pte. Ltd.   

8 KAKI BUKIT AVENUE 4. PREMIER@KAKI BUKIT #03-19 S415875.   
 

Contact Person:  Shah - 9716 6502 
 
If we do not receive any reply from you within the sƟpulated Ɵmeline, our client shall proceed to repair the vehicle without further reference to you.  
 
Kindly revert.  
 
 
Regards 
 
Cindy Tan  
On behalf of Mr Kannan 
 
M/S KANNAN SG 
Advocates & solicitors  
50 Chin Swee Road  
#08-03 Thong Chai Building 
Singapore 169874 
 
TEL:  (+65) 6429 0253 
FAX: (+65) 6223 1660 
 
**********************************************************************************************************************************************
*********************************** 
 
IMPORTANT: THIS E-MAIL IS INTENDED ONLY FOR THE USE OF THE ADDRESSEE AND MAY CONTAIN CONFIDENTIAL 
INFORMATION AND/OR MAY BE COVERED BY PROFESSIONAL PRIVILEGE. IT MUST NOT BE READ, USED OR DISCLOSED BY ANY 
PERSON OTHER THAN THE ADDRESSEE(S) NAMED. IF YOU HAVE RECEIVED THIS E-MAIL IN ERROR, PLEASE NOTIFY US 
IMMEDIATELY BY TELEPHONE (COLLECT INTERNATIONAL CALL IF APPROPRIATE) AT (+65) 6429 0252 OR BY E-MAIL AND 
DELETE THE E-MAIL IMMEDIATELY. THANK YOU. 
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**********************************************************************************************************************************************
*********************************** 
 


