Rajes (LKK Auto)

From: Lim, Sharon (Allianz Insurance Singapore) <sharon.lim@allianz.sg>
Sent: Friday, 14 July 2023 3:25 PM
To: assignments
Subject: FW: ARRANGE OWN DAMAGED CLAIM SURVEY FOR SLA6947G ACCIDENT ON
11-07-2023 OUR REF 2023 32010561
Attachments: KM_206_230713165137.pdf
Internal
Dear LKK

OD survey please, OD excess is $600.

Thank you.

Sharon Lim
Claims & Performance Management Department

Allianz Insurance Singapore Pte. Ltd. | UEN 201903913C
79 Robinson Road #09-01 Singapore 068897

From: kennychan@alanutd.com <kennychan@alanutd.com>

Sent: Thursday, 13 July 2023 5:05 pm

To: Motor Claims (Allianz Insurance Singapore) <claims@allianz.com.sg>

Subject: [EXT] ARRANGE OWN DAMAGED CLAIM SURVEY FOR SLA6947G ACCIDENT ON 11-07-2023

Dear Motor Claims Dept.

Please arrange surveyor to survey vehicle SLA6947G for doing own damaged claim repair at our workshop accident
on 11-07-2023 thank you .

Regards

Kenny

Alan’s United Auto Pte Ltd
64538686



