Meng Yan (LKK Auto)

From: Claims <claims@budgetdirect.com.sg>

Sent: Thursday, 13 July 2023 3:48 pm

To: admin-d; SUR; assignments

Cc: Derrick Quok; Kenneth Lim; Don Bong; Caleen Yit; Jason Tea Chee Kiat

Subject: TPPD survey: Claim ref: C10023453 /CY || Ol- SKS697J (Black) TP-GBD58P || Est: $13,267.04 || J-Mart Motor PL
Attachments: C10023453 - TP (GBD58P).zip

Hi Team,

We would like to request TP survey for GBD58P. TP chose LKK to survey the vehicle.
Please be informed that our insured has yet to report the accident.

Workshop information:
Address:

J-MART MOTOR PTE

Block 5, Defu Lane 10, #01-578,
Defu Industicl Park C, Singapore 539184
Tel: 6343-0934 Fax: 4343-0921
Email ; jmartauto@gmail.com
Ranistrrtion Mo 2074007440
Contact: Angie

Please confirm assignment.
Thank you.
Warmest Regards,

Frauleine Khoo
Admin Executive, Claims

T +65 6989 3696
F +65 6725 0853
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From: jmart jmart <jmartauto@gmail.com>

Sent: Thursday, July 13,2023 3:11 PM

To: Claims <claims@budgetdirect.com.sg>

Subject: Re: PRI Request on 13.07.2023 | | C10023453/CY | | GBD 58P claiming against SKS 697J DOA 12/7/2023

Hi

Kindly arrange LKK to conduct the survey. Thank you



From: J-Mart <jmartauto@gmail.com>
Sent: Thursday, July 13, 2023 2:41 PM

To: Claims <claims@budgetdirect.com.sg>
Subject: GBD 58P claiming against SKS 697) DOA 12/7/2023

Hi,

Kindly refer me the surveyor names. Thank you.

Regards,

Angie



