Meng Yan (LKK Auto)

From: Harminder Kaur <Harminder@msfirstcapital.com.sg>

Sent: Thursday, 13 July 2023 3:02 pm

To: assignments

Cc: Esther Lim; Ryder Auto workshop

Subject: FW: NON REPORTING D23002460MFCV/GBL/TPD: PRE-REPAIR INSPECTION: GBF3893P & GBC9411Z On 12 Jul 2023
Attachments: GBF3893P GIA.pdf; MT00015920 is Approved; MSA.pdf; GBF3893P PRS NOTICE.pdf

Dear Sirs,

Enclosed documents for survey.

Thank You.

Best Regards,

Harminder Kaur

Motor Claims

MS First Capital Insurance Ltd
16 Raffles Quay

#42-01 Hong Leong Building
Singapore 048581

T: 6507 3848 | F: 6507 3849
Website http://www.msfirstcapital.com.sg
A Member of INSEETANE INSURANCE GROUP

Personal Data Protection Act 2012 ("PDPA"):

Under the PDPA, there are various requirements that regulate the processing of your personal data. Please refer to http://www.msfirstcapital.com.sg for details of PDPA Personal Data Collection
Statement.

Confidentiality Notice: This e-mail is confidential. It may also be legally privileged. If you are not the addressee or to whom it is intended, you may not copy, forward, disclose or use any part of it. If you
have received this message in error, please delete the message and all copies from your system and notify the sender immediately by return e-mail.

From: Ryder Auto workshop <ryderautoworkshop@gmail.com>

Sent: Thursday, July 13,2023 11:47 AM

To: CWS Motor Claims <cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg>

Subject: Urgent: PRE-REPAIR INSPECTION: Your Vehicle GBC9411Z; Our Vehicle GBF3893P Accident involving GBF3893P & GBC9411Z On 13 Jul 2023




Dear Sir/Mdm,

We refer to the above matter.

Kindly find attached PRS for your necessary action.

For Direct Settlement cases, we only use your in-house surveyor. Kindly arrange your in-house surveyor.

Thank you.

Best regards

Zeph

2 Kaki Bukit Ave 2, #02-19 / 22 / 28, Autohub, Singapore 417921

Tel : 67418277 Fax: 67468277 HP : 90908277







