
TPPD survey: Claim ref: C10023411 /JY || OI- SMQ4066R (White) TP-
SJX2355T || Est: $0.00 || T K Lee Automotive PL

Claims <claims@budgetdirect.com.sg>
Wed 12/7/2023 11<22 AM

To: admin-d <admin-d@lkkauto.com>;SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>;assignments
<assignments@lkkauto.com>
Cc: Derrick Quok <derrick.q@budgetdirect.com.sg>;Kenneth Lim
<kenneth.lim@budgetdirect.com.sg>;Don Bong <don.bong@budgetdirect.com.sg>;Teo Jie Yang
<jieyang.teo@budgetdirect.com.sg>

1 attachments (2 MB)
C10023411 - TP (SJX2355T).zip;

Hi Team,
 
We would like to request TP survey for SJX2355T.  TP chose LKK to survey the vehicle.
 
Workshop information:
Address:      

 
Please confirm assignment. 
 
Thank you.
 
Warmest Regards,
 
Frauleine Khoo
Admin Executive, Claims
 
 
T +65 6989 3696
F +65 6725 0853 
E frauleine.khoo@budgetdirect.com.sg
 

 
Customer Care +65 6221 2111
Claims +65 6221 2199
Claims (Int.) +65 6540 2199
 
190 Clemenceau Avenue, #03-01

mailto:frauleine.khoo@budgetdirect.com.sg


Singapore Shopping Centre
Singapore
239924                                                                                                                       
         
budgetdirect.com.sg
 

 
Auto & General Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Limited (Co. Reg. No. 201626103G) trading as
Budget Direct Insurance.
 
This email is sent by Auto & General (SEA) Services Pte. Limited or a related body corporate
(Auto & General) and is for the intended addressee. The views expressed in this email and
attachments (email) reflect the views of the stated author but may not reflect views of Auto &
General. This email is confidential and subject to copyright. It may be privileged. If you are not
the intended addressee, confidentiality and privilege have not been waived and any use,
interference with, or disclosure of this email is unauthorised.

 
 
From: T K Lee <tklee0247@gmail.com> 
Sent: Wednesday, July 12, 2023 9:50 AM
To: Claims <claims@budgetdirect.com.sg>
Subject: Re: PRI Request on 11.07.2023 || C10023411/JY || Accident involving SJX2355T &
SMQ4066R on 10/07/2023 at Alexandra Road turning towards Queensway
 
Dear Sir/Mdm, 
 
We would like to appoint LKK to conduct PRI for our client's vehicle. 
 
Thank you.
 

Warmest Regards,

Xue Ting

T K Lee Automotive Pte Ltd

1 Kaki Bukit Ave 6, Autobay, #02-47

Singapore 417883

Tel: 65095521

 

 
From: T K Lee <tklee0247@gmail.com> 
Sent: Tuesday, July 11, 2023 4:40 PM
To: Claims <claims@budgetdirect.com.sg>
Subject: Accident involving SJX2355T & SMQ4066R on 10/07/2023 at Alexandra Road
turning towards Queensway
 
Dear Sir/Mdm,

https://www.budgetdirect.com.sg/?utm_source=signature&utm_medium=email&utm_term=bdi_e-signature_all_homepage_1x1&utm_campaign=email
https://www.autogeneral.com.sg/?utm_source=signature&utm_medium=email&utm_term=a&g_e-signature_all_homepage_1x1&utm_campaign=email
https://www.budgetdirect.com.sg/?utm_source=signature&utm_medium=email&utm_term=bdi_e-signature_all_homepage_1x1&utm_campaign=email
mailto:tklee0247@gmail.com
mailto:claims@budgetdirect.com.sg


Our Ref: SJX2355T
Your Ref: SMQ4066R (Budget Direct)

Kindly arrange PRI and let us have the surveyor list to choose from.

Thank You

Warmest Regards,
Xue Ting
T K Lee Automotive Pte Ltd
1 Kaki Bukit Ave 6, Autobay, #02-47
Singapore 417883
Tel: 65095521


