Meng Yan (LKK Auto)

From: Claims <claims@budgetdirect.com.sg>

Sent: Monday, 10 July 2023 9:58 am

To: admin-d; assignments; SUR

Cc: Shafawati Bte Md Rabu; Derrick Quok; Kenneth Lim; Don Bong

Subject: TPPD survey: Claim ref: C10023338/SR || OI-SLZ6508) (SILVER) TP-SLR1016L || Est: $0 || Thiam Heng Huat Pte Ltd
Attachments: C10023338 - SLR1016L.zip

Hi Team,

We wish to appoint LKK to conduct survey for the TP vehicle number: SLR1016L

Please kindly take note that the officer in-charge is Ms. @Shafawati Bte Md Rabu. , who is copied in the email.
We appreciate if you can keep her in the loop.

Thiam Heng Huat Pte Ltd
82636295 Steven
176 Sin Ming Dr, #05-14, Singapore 575721

Please find attached GIA reports for your reference.
Thank you.
Best regards,

Maybie Chua
Admin Executive, Claims

F +65 6725 0853
E maybie.chua@budgetdirect.com.sg

It pays to choose -

Budget =
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From: Thiam Heng Huat <thh176@yahoo.com>

Sent: Monday, 10 July 2023 9:33 am

To: Claims <claims@budgetdirect.com.sg>

Subject: Re: PRI Request On 07-07-2023 | | AGI Ref: C10023338 | | SLR1016L & SLZ6508) DOA: 07.07.23

Dear Maybie,
Please arrange for LKK to conduct the survey.

Warmest regards,
Steven

Thiam Heng Huat Pte Ltd
82636295

From: Thiam Heng Huat <thh176@yahoo.com>

Sent: Friday, 7 July 2023 5:55 pm

To: Claims <claims@budgetdirect.com.sg>

Subject: REQUEST FOR PRS - SLR1016L YOUR INSURED: SLZ6508J DOA: 07.07.23

Dear Motor Claims Team,

We refer to the attachments.

Kindly assist to register our client’s TP claim and let us have your list of nominated surveyors within the next 2 working days from date
of this email.

Please respond soonest possible.



Warmest regards,
Steven
Thiam Heng Huat Pte Ltd

82636295



