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Meng Yan (LKK Auto)

From: Harminder Kaur <Harminder@msfirstcapital.com.sg>
Sent: Monday, 10 July 2023 2:18 pm
To: assignments
Cc: Vic Alpeh S. Sanghilan; 'Claims Department'
Subject: RE: D23002367MFCV/PTE/TPD1  SDS 5525 Y AND YOUR INSURED GBD 2072 J DATED 5/7/2023
Attachments: MSA.pdf; MT00015908 is Approved; PA06352023 - SDS 5525 Y - AUDI Q2 1.4 TFSI S - REAR - MS FIRST CAPITAL (TP).pdf; SDS 

5525 Y - 05072023 .pdf

Dear Sirs, 
 
Enclosed documents for survey. 
 
Thank You. 
 
 
Best Regards, 
Harminder Kaur 
Motor Claims  
MS First Capital Insurance Ltd  
16 Raffles Quay 
#42-01 Hong Leong Building 
Singapore 048581 
 
T: 6507 3848 | F: 6507 3849 
Website http://www.msfirstcapital.com.sg 

 
 
Personal Data Protection Act 2012 ("PDPA"): 
Under the PDPA, there are various requirements that regulate the processing of your personal data. Please refer to http://www.msfirstcapital.com.sg for details of PDPA Personal Data Collection 
Statement. 
Confidentiality Notice: This e-mail is confidential. It may also be legally privileged. If you are not the addressee or to whom it is intended, you may not copy, forward, disclose or use any part of it. If you 
have received this message in error, please delete the message and all copies from your system and notify the sender immediately by return e-mail. 

 
 
 
 

From: Claims <claims@premiumauto.com.sg>  
Sent: Saturday, July 8, 2023 2:28 PM 
To: Motor_Claims <Motor_Claims@msfirstcapital.com.sg> 
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Cc: 'Claims' <claims@premiumauto.com.sg> 
Subject: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SDS 5525 Y AND YOUR INSURED GBD 2072 J DATED 5/7/2023 
 
Dear all, 
 
Kindly assist in the liability clearance for above mentioned case. We are in the opinion that our client is not the proximate cause of the accident. 
 
Therefore, we propose for direct settlement at 100% liability clearance in our clients favour. 
 
Please advise who the officer in-charge we shall liaise with.  
 
Attached are the GIA report , repair estimate and video footage  for your reference  
 
Kindly arrange for car survey on 11 of July @11am at Audi Ubi Service centre, owner waiting. 
 
Thank you.   
 
Best regards,  
George Wong  
Claims advisor  
 

 
(Reg No 199902271W)  
281 Alexandra Road   Singapore 159938    
p. +65 6366 2323 d. 66900293 
e. Claims@premiumauto.com.sg   w. www.audi.com.sg  
Audi Showroom   281 Alexandra Road   Singapore 159938   p. +65 68362223 
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Email Disclaimer 
This email, including any attachment, is confidential and may also be privileged. 
If you have received it in error, please notify us immediately by reply email and then delete this message from your system. 
Please do not copy it or use it for any purpose, or disclose its contents or any attachment to any other person. Thank you 
 


