Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

From: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

Sent: Tuesday, 11 July 2023 12:16 PM

To: GERALD POH WEE BIN; SUR; Investigation; Naz (LKKAuto); ENG HUEY NI

Cc: MT_Claim_SG

Subject: RE: OREF: 22/23/23/VC05/027650 (Huey Ni's case) - FW: FW: GIA REPORT FOR
GBC1782E

Attachments: GBC1782E IA.pdf; GBC 1782E MARKED ESTIMATE.pdf

Dear Huey Ni,

Enclosed herewith preliminary advice of GBC 1782E.
Pending for investigation.

We have not authorise repair.

Best Regards,

Shiau Chan (Ms) | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
Phone: 6256-3561 | email: siewsc@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Meng Yan (LKK Auto) <mengyan@Ikkauto.com>

Sent: Friday, July 7, 2023 10:16 AM

To: GERALD POH WEE BIN <geraldpoh@Ilonpac.com>; SUR <sur@Ikkauto.com>; Investigation
<investigation@lkkauto.com>; Naz (LKKAuto) <Naz@I|kkauto.com>

Cc: MT_Claim_SG <mt_claim@lonpac.com>; assignments <assignments@lkkauto.com>; Bryan Ang (LKKAuto)
<bryanang@Ikkauto.com>; Winnie Foo (LKKAuto) <winniefoo@Ikkauto.com>

Subject: RE: OREF: 22/23/23/VC05/027650 (Huey Ni's case) - FW: FW: GIA REPORT FOR GBC1782E

Dear Gerald,

Thank you for the assignment.

Best Regards,
Yan | Admin
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6741-8434 / Whatsapp call: 87813698 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: GERALD POH WEE BIN <geraldpoh@Ilonpac.com>
Sent: Friday, July 7, 2023 6:16 AM
To: Bryan Ang (LKKAuto) <bryanang@Ikkauto.com>




Cc: MT_Claim_SG <mt_claim@lonpac.com>; assignments <assignments@l|kkauto.com>
Subject: OREF: 22/23/23/VC05/027650 (Huey Ni's case) - FW: FW: GIA REPORT FOR GBC1782E

Lonpac External - General
Lonpac External - General

Dear Bryan,
Please proceed to conduct the survey and establish the causes leading to the fire.
We attached the following for your attention :

1) Estimate from KM Motor
2) Servicing records for the months of January, March and May 2023
3) Insured’s report

Best Regards

Gerald Poh

Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd

300 Beach Road, #17-04/06 The Concourse, Singapore 199555
Tel: (65) 6250 7388 Ext.255 | Fax: (65) 6296 2706

We are committed to acting professionally, fairly and with integrity. We do not condone bribery, fraud or corrupt
practices.

From: motor km <motor@km.com.sg>

Sent: Thursday, July 6, 2023 4:28 PM

To: GERALD POH WEE BIN <geraldpoh@lonpac.com>
Cc: MT_Claim_SG <mt_claim@lonpac.com>

Subject: Re: FW: GIA REPORT FOR GBC1782E

Dear Gerald,

Please find the attached file as per your request.

Should you require further clarification please contact me at 9753 8067.

Thank you.

Regards,
Vicki



We are committed to acting professionally, fairly and with integrity. We do not condone bribery, fraud or corrupt
practices.

On Thu, Jul 6, 2023 at 6:20 AM GERALD POH WEE BIN <geraldpoh@Ilonpac.com> wrote:

Lonpac External - General

Lonpac External - General

Dear Vicki,

As spoken, please let us have the following :-

A. Estimate
B. Last servicing and maintenance records of the vehicle.

Best Regards

Gerald Poh
Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd
300 Beach Road, #17-04/06 The Concourse, Singapore 199555

Tel: (65) 6250 7388 Ext.255 | Fax: (65) 6296 2706



We are committed to acting professionally, fairly and with integrity. We do not condone bribery, fraud or corrupt
practices.

From: motor km <motor@km.com.sg>
Sent: Wednesday, July 5, 2023 3:10 PM

To: MT_Claim_SG <mt_claim@I|onpac.com>
Subject: Fwd: GIA REPORT FOR GBC1782E

Dear Sir

We spoke, kindly find the attached GIA report for your perusal.

Should you require further clarification please contact me at 9753 8067.

Thank you.

Regards,

Vicki

We are committed to acting professionally, fairly and with integrity. We do not condone bribery, fraud or corrupt
practices.



