Mei Kwan (LKKAuto)

From: Rajes (LKK Auto)

Sent: Thursday, 6 July 2023 3:32 PM

To: Motor Claims (Allianz Insurance Singapore); Admin A

Cc: assignments

Subject: RE: DIRECT SETTLEMENT OF VEHICLE NO. SNA1564L AGAINST SLA700R (ALLIANZ)
Categories: HMK

Dear Shanti,

Thank you for the assignment.
Repairer arrange survey on 07/07/2023.

Best Regards,
Rajes | Admin
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6741-8434 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Motor Claims (Allianz Insurance Singapore) <claims@allianz.com.sg>

Sent: Thursday, July 6, 2023 2:39 PM

To: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>

Cc: admin-d <admin-d@lkkauto.com>

Subject: FW: DIRECT SETTLEMENT OF VEHICLE NO. SNA1564L AGAINST SLA700R (ALLIANZ)

Internal

Your ref: SNA1564L

Our ref: SLA700R

Dear Sirs,

We hereby appoint our direct settlement partners LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD to conduct survey.
Kindly engage with them to arrange for survey.

Rueben Thomas
Bodyshop Service Advisor
Kah Motor Body Repair Centre

Honda Singapore

Kah Motor Co. Sdn. Bhd.

15 Ubi Road 4, S(408610)
DID/Mobile: 68465672 / 90721766

Oi non reporting - MYCAR Leasing Pte Ltd



wy@mycar.com.sg

65700007
Thank you.

Best regards,

Shanti. R

Claims Service

Allianz Insurance Singapore Pte. Ltd. | UEN 201903913C
79 Robinson Road #09-01 | Singapore 068897

Phone: +65 6395 3836 | www.allianz.sg

OQS | Allianz @ |

This e-mail and any files transmitted with it is intended only for the named recipients and may contain confidential and /
or privileged information. If you are not the intended recipient, please do not read, copy, use or disclose the contents of
this communication to others and notify the sender immediately. Then please delete the e-mail and any copies of it.
Thank you.

&5 Please consider the environment before printing this e-mail.

From: Jeshurueben Rao Thomas <jeshurueben@honda.com.sg>

Sent: Thursday, 6 July 2023 9:22 am

To: Motor Claims (Allianz Insurance Singapore) <claims@allianz.com.sg>

Subject: [EXT] FW: DIRECT SETTLEMENT OF VEHICLE NO. SNA1564L AGAINST SLA700R (ALLIANZ)

Resent

Best Regards,

Rueben Thomas

Bodyshop Service Advisor
Kah Motor Body Repair Centre

Honda Singapore

Kah Motor Co. Sdn. Bhd.

15 Ubi Road 4, S(408610)
DID/Mobile: 68465672 / 90721766
Web: www.honda.com.sg
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From: Jeshurueben Rao Thomas

Sent: Wednesday, July 5, 2023 9:27 AM

To: Claims Banca (Allianz Insurance Singapore) <claims@allianz.com.sg>

Subject: DIRECT SETTLEMENT OF VEHICLE NO. SNA1564L AGAINST SLA700R (ALLIANZ)




To The Officer In Charge,

Please Refer To The Above Attachment For Your Reference.

Kindly Help To Arrange Surveyor To Survey This Vehicle SNA1564L. *VEHICLE IN*

Please Also Advice On The Liability Status Of This Claim For Direct Settlement On This Chain Collision Accident.
Your Insured Vehicle Number is SLA700R, Accident Date 03/07/2023.

Thank You

Best Regards,

Rueben Thomas

Bodyshop Service Advisor
Kah Motor Body Repair Centre

Honda Singapore

Kah Motor Co. Sdn. Bhd.

15 Ubi Road 4, S(408610)
DID/Mobile: 68465672 / 90721766
Web: www.honda.com.sg

.- You
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Confidential Note: The information contained in this email is intended only for the use of the individual
or entity named above and may contain information that is privileged, confidential and exempt from
disclosure under applicable law. If the reader of this message is not the intended recipient, you are
hereby notified that any dissemination, distribution or copying of this communication is strictly
prohibited. If you have received this message in error, please immediately notify the sender and delete
the mail. Thank you.



