
1

Huey Yon (LKKAuto)

From: Huey Yon (LKKAuto)

Sent: Wednesday, 5 July 2023 9:50 AM

To: Goh, Jeremy

Cc: SUR

Subject: RE: <checking on market value> AIG ref: 7078512798SG - 003      TP vehicle: SMJ 

1081 C

Dear Jeremy, 

 

The MV of SMJ 1081C is $23K-$25K (est) as at March 2023. 

 
Best Regards, 

Huey Yon | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants 

phone: 6256-3561 | email: hueyyon@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

 

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto) <veronchen@lkkauto.com>  

Sent: Wednesday, July 5, 2023 9:23 AM 

To: Goh, Jeremy <Jeremy.Goh@aig.com>; LKK Valuation <valuation@lkkauto.com>; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: RE: <checking on market value> AIG ref: 7078512798SG - 003 TP vehicle: SMJ 1081 C 

 

Dear Jeremy, 

 

Thank you for the email. 

 

 

Dear Huey Yon, 

 

Kindly assist. 

 

 
Best Regards, 

Veron Chen | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

 
 

From: Goh, Jeremy <Jeremy.Goh@aig.com>  

Sent: Wednesday, July 5, 2023 9:21 AM 

To: Veron Chen (LKKAuto) <veronchen@lkkauto.com>; LKK Valuation <valuation@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: RE: <checking on market value> AIG ref: 7078512798SG - 003 TP vehicle: SMJ 1081 C 

 

Dear Veron, 

 

Any updates on the market value assessment for the vehicle? 

 
Regards 
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Jeremy Goh 
Complex Claims Examiner – Auto Property Damage Claims 
AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd.  
 
AIG Building 
78 Shenton Way, Level 10 
Singapore 079120 
Tel +(65) 6419 1767 
Jeremy.goh@aig.com  |  www.AIG.com.sg 
 
If you have received this message outside of your usual work hours, I do not expect that you will read, respond to or action it until appropriate for you. 

 

 

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto) <veronchen@lkkauto.com>  

Sent: Thursday, June 22, 2023 2:13 PM 

To: LKK Valuation <valuation@lkkauto.com>; Goh, Jeremy <Jeremy.Goh@aig.com> 

Subject: [EXTERNAL] FW: <checking on market value> AIG ref: 7078512798SG - 003 TP vehicle: SMJ 1081 C 

 

This message is from an external sender; be cautious with links and attachments. 

Dear Jeremy, 

 

Thank you for the email. 

 

 

Dear Huey Yon, 

 

Kindly assist. 

 

 
Best Regards, 

Veron Chen | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

 
 

From: Goh, Jeremy <Jeremy.Goh@aig.com>  

Sent: Thursday, June 22, 2023 2:09 PM 

To: Veron Chen (LKKAuto) <veronchen@lkkauto.com>; LKK Valuation <valuation@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: FW: <checking on market value> AIG ref: 7078512798SG - 003 TP vehicle: SMJ 1081 C 

 

Hi Veron,  

 

Seeking your kind help to see what is the market value of the Third Party vehicle. 

 

And whether, there is any economical value to repair the car. 
 
Regards 
Jeremy Goh 
Complex Claims Examiner – Auto Property Damage Claims 
AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd.  
 
AIG Building 
78 Shenton Way, Level 10 
Singapore 079120 
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Tel +(65) 6419 1767 
Jeremy.goh@aig.com  |  www.AIG.com.sg 
 
If you have received this message outside of your usual work hours, I do not expect that you will read, respond to or action it until appropriate for you. 
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