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Meng Yan (LKK Auto)

From: Claims <claims@budgetdirect.com.sg>
Sent: Tuesday, 4 July 2023 2:17 pm
To: admin-d; SUR; assignments
Cc: Derrick Quok; Kenneth Lim; Don Bong; Shafawati Bte Md Rabu
Subject: OD survey: Claim ref: C10023228 /SR || OI-SLR5165M (Black) TP-NA || Est: $0.00 || Exs: $600.00 || Maximus Auto Services Pte Ltd
Attachments: C10023228 - OD (SLR5165M).zip

Hi LKK Team,  
 
OD survey for SLR5165M. Please assist us this survey/investigations. 
 
Insured’s car is badly damaged after the accident, but he continued to drive home.  
The front and undercarriage are badly affected, there may be consequential damages as the cooling system is likely to be affected. 
Please assist us to check on OIV for any consequential damages (undercarriage). 
 
Driver – MD / ND 
Further excess – NA 
Any workshop: Yes  
Transport allowance – NA 
OD Towing Recovery estimated amount - NA 
Modification: No 
Authorise : No (Policy yet to be verified, Renewal pop up) 
 
GIA Reports uploaded in Sharepoint. 
 
Thank you.  
 
Warmest Regards, 
 
Frauleine Khoo 
Admin Executive, Claims 
 
T +65 6989 3696 
F +65 6725 0853   
E frauleine.khoo@budgetdirect.com.sg 
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Customer Care +65 6221 2111 
Claims +65 6221 2199 
Claims (Int.) +65 6540 2199 
 
190 Clemenceau Avenue, #03-01 
Singapore Shopping Centre 
Singapore 239924                                                                                                                                  
budgetdirect.com.sg 
 

 
 
Auto & General Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Limited (Co. Reg. No. 201626103G) trading as Budget Direct Insurance. 
 
This email is sent by Auto & General (SEA) Services Pte. Limited or a related body corporate (Auto & General) and is for the intended 
addressee. The views expressed in this email and attachments (email) reflect the views of the stated author but may not reflect views of Auto 
& General. This email is confidential and subject to copyright. It may be privileged. If you are not the intended addressee, confidentiality and 
privilege have not been waived and any use, interference with, or disclosure of this email is unauthorised.  

 
 
 

From: Daphne Tan <daphne@maximusracing.com>  
Sent: Monday, July 3, 2023 5:23 PM 
To: Claims <claims@budgetdirect.com.sg> 
Subject: Own Damage Claim for SLR5165M, Accident 01/07/2023, Along Sixth Ave. 
 
Dear Sir / Mdm, 
 
We would like to put up a claim on OWN DAMAGE for vehicle SLR5165M. Accident happened on 01/07/2023 23:08, along Sixth Avenue. 
 
Please see attached on the accident report. 
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I would like to inform that vehicle is currently at our repair workshop.  

Maximus Auto Services Pte Ltd 

7, Soon Lee Street,  
#05-05, iSpace 

Singapore 627608 
 
Please contact myself, Daphne Tan tel: 96382477 for survey. 
I am currently in the midst of preparing the estimate for surveyor. 
 
B.Rgds 

 
Daphne Tan 

 


