Mei Kwan (LKKAuto)

From: Janice Chang <janice@sngahtee.com>

Sent: Monday, 17 July 2023 1:42 PM

To: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto)

Cc: Admin A; EzLyna (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: ACCIDENT INVOLVING OUR CLIENT'S VEH SLJ248H & AIG'S INSURED SLV8014A
ON 01/07/2023 *** LKK REF: CC6/AIG23006653/ya3

Attachments: SLJ248H - CANCEL CLAIM FORM.pdf

Importance: High

Hi Mei Kwan,

Please withdraw the claim for the above.
Please refer to the attached signed cancel claim form.
Thank You.

Best Regards

Janice Chang | Senior Admin

SNG AH TEE MOTOR & PANEL SERVICE PTE LTD | BLK 3 PIONEER ROAD NORTH #01-18 SINGAPORE 628457
TEL: 62686183 (4LINES) | FAX: 62681429 | Find us at http://www.sngahtee.com

SNGAHTE

MOTOR & PANEL SE

-All offers/acceptances are made, based without prejudice.-

From: Janice Chang <janice@sngahtee.com>

Sent: Wednesday, July 12, 2023 12:59 PM

To: 'Mei Kwan (LKKAuto)' <Meikwan@lkkauto.com>

Cc: 'Admin A' <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; 'EzLyna (LKKAuto)' <ezlyna@Ikkauto.com>

Subject: RE: ACCIDENT INVOLVING OUR CLIENT'S VEH SLJ248H & AIG'S INSURED SLV8014A ON 01/07/2023 *** LKK REF:
CC6/A1G23006653/ya3

Importance: High

Hi Mei Kwan,

My client don’t have any evidence as insured did not stop on the spot.
Thank You.

Best Regards

Janice Chang | Senior Admin



SNG AH TEE MOTOR & PANEL SERVICE PTE LTD | BLK 3 PIONEER ROAD NORTH #01-18 SINGAPORE 628457
TEL: 62686183 (4LINES) | FAX: 62681429 | Find us at http://www.sngahtee.com

SNGAHTE

MOTOR & PANEL SE

-All offers/acceptances are made, based without prejudice.-

From: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) <Meikwan@lkkauto.com>

Sent: Tuesday, July 4, 2023 4:28 PM

To: Janice Chang <janice@sngahtee.com>

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; EzLyna (LKKAuto) <ezlyna@I|kkauto.com>

Subject: RE: ACCIDENT INVOLVING OUR CLIENT'S VEH SLJ248H & AIG'S INSURED SLV8014A ON 01/07/2023 *** LKK REF:
CC6/A1G23006653/ya3

Dear Sir / Madam,

We refer to the above matter.

Please be informed that our insured has yet to report the accident.
Please provide us the following and arrange for survey.

o evidence i.e. video and scene photo (if any)
e PIRresult (if any)

Please note that for liability, claim negotiation and settlement, please contact Lyna.

To check availability of the case handler, you may contact the undersigned.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Mei Kwan | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6366 0055 | email: MeiKwan@lkkauto.com

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Janice Chang <janice@sngahtee.com>

Sent: Tuesday, July 4, 2023 4:26 PM

To: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; SUR <sur@l|kkauto.com>

Subject: RE: ACCIDENT INVOLVING OUR CLIENT'S VEH SLJ248H & AIG'S INSURED SLV8014A ON 01/07/2023
Importance: High

REMINDER
Hi,
We refer to the above & wish to check liability for the above case.

Have AIG’s insured reported the accident ?
Is liability in our client’s favour ?



Hope to hear from you soon.
Thank You.

Best Regards

Janice Chang | Senior Admin

SNG AH TEE MOTOR & PANEL SERVICE PTE LTD | BLK 3 PIONEER ROAD NORTH #01-18 SINGAPORE 628457
TEL: 62686183 (4LINES) | FAX: 62681429 | Find us at http://www.sngahtee.com

SNGAHTE

MOTOR & PANEL SE

-All offers/acceptances are made, based without prejudice.-

From: Janice Chang <janice@sngahtee.com>

Sent: Monday, July 3, 2023 4:39 PM

To: Admin A <admin-a@Ikkauto.com>; 'sur@lkkauto.com' <sur@I|kkauto.com>

Subject: ACCIDENT INVOLVING OUR CLIENT'S VEH SLJ248H & AIG'S INSURED SLV8014A ON 01/07/2023
Importance: High

Hi,

We refer to the above & wish to check liability for the above case.
Have AIG’s insured reported the accident ?

Is liability in our client’s favour ?

Hope to hear from you soon.

Thank You.

Best Regards

Janice Chang | Senior Admin

SNG AH TEE MOTOR & PANEL SERVICE PTE LTD | BLK 3 PIONEER ROAD NORTH #01-18 SINGAPORE 628457
TEL: 62686183 (4LINES) | FAX: 62681429 | Find us at http://www.sngahtee.com

SNGAHTE

MOTOR & PANEL SE

-All offers/acceptances are made, based without prejudice.-



