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Huey Yon (LKKAuto)

From: Taufikh (LKKAuto)

Sent: Monday, 17 July 2023 8:34 PM

To: Catherine Lee Sau Chan (Strides Automotive Services Pte Ltd)

Cc: Huey Yon (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: Finalisation - SMB242D (BUS/06/23/5052) - INCOME

Attachments: 242 marking.pdf; ARC - Repair Estimate - SMB242D_06235052.pdf; 

WO_SMB242D.pdf

Hi Catherine, 

 

COR l/s $1900 , 2 days. 

 

Subject to insurance approval 

 

Regards 

Taufikh 

Lkk Auto 

 

 

From: Catherine Lee Sau Chan (Strides Automotive Services Pte Ltd) <Catherine.Lee@stridespremier.com.sg>  

Sent: Monday, July 17, 2023 1:51 PM 

To: Taufikh (LKKAuto) <Taufikh@lkkauto.com>; Finalization <finalization@lkkauto.com>; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>; 

Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com> 

Cc: Koo Yew Chung (Strides Automotive Services Pte Ltd) <YewChung.Koo@stridespremier.com.sg>; AutoSvs-ARC 

(Bus) <AutoSvs-ARCBus@smrt.com.sg> 

Subject: Finalisation - SMB242D (BUS/06/23/5052) - INCOME 

 

Hi Taufikh 

 

Attached herewith our copy and your marked copy of the bus repair estimate for the case.  

Our finalise amount @ $1,900/- with 2 working day under lump sum  repair. Attached after repaired photos for your 

perusal.  

 

Please confirm the COR by return email ASAP. 

 

NOTE: There is a towing fee @$200.00 will be submitted via LOD. Attached WO for your perusal. 

 

 
Thank you 

 
Best Regards 
Catherine Lee 
Strides Automotive Services Pte Ltd 
(Accident Repair & Overhaul) 
DID: 6866 2669  Fax: 6368 5592 
Email: catherine.lee@stridespremier.com.sg 
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DISCLAIMER This electronic mail message and any files transmitted with it are intended exclusively for the individual 

or entity to which it is addressed. The message, together with any attachment, may contain confidential and/or 

privileged information. Any unauthorized review, use, printing, saving, copying, disclosure or distribution is strictly 

prohibited.If you, the reader are not the intended recipient, please do not disclose, disseminate, circulate, copy or 

use any of the information contained in this email. Please notify us immediately and delete the email and destroy 

any printed copy.  


