Huey Yon (LKKAuto)

From: Huey Yon (LKKAuto)

Sent: Friday, 7 July 2023 2:14 PM

To: Foo Ai Ngoh

Cc: SUR

Subject: RE: OD claims for yours insured Reg : GBM782)J - Ergo ref: CDMCG23001391 -

Please check for breach....

Dear Ai Ngoh,

According to our surveyor, upon reinspection, he did a test on the brake. Found out brake is on working condition,
no defect at all. Brake fluid is at its level. No sign of leaking.

Best Regards,

Huey Yon | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants

phone: 6256-3561 | email: hueyyon@Ikkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto) <veronchen@lkkauto.com>

Sent: Friday, July 7, 2023 9:34 AM

To: Foo Ai Ngoh <aingoh.foo@ergo.com.sg>; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>

Cc: chuah gary <perfect_automobile@hotmail.com>

Subject: RE: OD claims for yours insured Reg : GBM782)J - Ergo ref: CDMCG23001391 - Please check for breach....

Dear Ai Ngoh,
Thank you for the email.
Dear Huey Yon,

FYNA--- CS/EGI23006640/Rny3

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Foo Ai Ngoh <aingoh.foo@ergo.com.sg>

Sent: Friday, July 7, 2023 9:29 AM

To: Veron Chen (LKKAuto) <veronchen@Ikkauto.com>

Cc: chuah gary <perfect_automobile@hotmail.com>

Subject: RE: OD claims for yours insured Reg : GBM782)J - Ergo ref: CDMCG23001391 - Please check for breach....

Dear Gary
For your assessment please...



Veron, please note for amount above $10,000/-, you need to send it to GARY for assessment...

Thanking you

Regards
Ai Ngoh

From: Foo Ai Ngoh

Sent: Friday, July 7, 2023 9:23 AM

To: Veron Chen (LKKAuto) <veronchen@Ikkauto.com>

Subject: RE: OD claims for yours insured Reg : GBM782)J - Ergo ref: CDMCG23001391 - Please check for breach....

Sorry —amendment —

The driver reported the brakes are not responding.....

Regards
Ai Ngoh

From: Foo Ai Ngoh

Sent: Monday, July 3, 2023 11:24 AM

To: 'Veron Chen (LKKAuto)' <veronchen@Ikkauto.com>

Subject: OD claims for yours insured Reg : GBM782) - Ergo ref: CDMCG23001391 - Please check for breach....

Dear LKK
Please check if the vehicle was properly maintained.

The driver claimed the vehicle was responding to the brakes. Please watch video clip in Merimen.

The excess is $2500
The Hood is insured up to $2000/-

Regards
Ai Ngoh
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