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Mei Kwan (LKKAuto)

From: Motor Claims (Allianz Insurance Singapore) <claims@allianz.com.sg>
Sent: Saturday, 1 July 2023 6:06 PM
To: Boon Chin Lan; Heng Swee Hee; Nur Ariff
Cc: assignments; Admin A
Subject: RE: Our ref : Hyundai Avante, SNB8172H - TP claim / Your ref: SMP1376X(OI)  , Toyota 
Attachments: SNB 8172 H - estimate.pdf; SK0R236U0002_30-06-2023_143436.pdf

Categories: HMK

Internal 
 
Dear Sirs,  
  
We hereby appoint our direct settlement partners  LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD  to conduct survey. 
  
Kindly engage with them to arrange for survey.  
   
Thank you. 
  
Claims Specialist 
Claims & Performance Management 
Allianz Insurance Singapore Pte. Ltd. | UEN 201903913C 
79 Robinson Road #09-01, Singapore 068897 
www.allianz.sg  
 

 

Please note: This e-mail and any files transmitted with it is intended only for the named recipients and may contain confidential and / or privileged 
information. If you are not the intended recipient, please do not read, copy, use or disclose the contents of this communication to others and notify the 
sender immediately. Then please delete the e-mail and any copies of it. Thank you. 

 Please consider the environment before printing this e-mail. 
 
 
 
 

From: Boon Chin Lan <boonchin.lan@hyundaimotors.com.sg>  
Sent: Friday, 30 June 2023 2:47 pm 
To: Motor Claims (Allianz Insurance Singapore) <claims@allianz.com.sg> 
Cc: Heng Swee Hee <shheng@hyundaimotors.com.sg>; Nur Ariff <nur.ariff@hyundaimotors.com.sg> 
Subject: [EXT] Our ref : Hyundai Avante, SNB8172H - TP claim / Your ref: SMP1376X , Toyota  
 
Hi, 
 
Please find aƩachment. 
 
Need your assist to arrange for accident survey at our workshop ( car  in )  
 
 
Thank you. 
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Best regards,  
  

Lan Boon Chin  
Vehicle Assessor 
KOMOCO MOTORS PTE LTD   |   253 Alexandra Road #01-01 Singapore 159936  
EXT: 68018884          HP: 90700157 
https://hyundai.com.sg  

 
 

Disclaimer  
This e-mail contains privileged or confidential information which is intended only for the use of the recipient(s) named 
above. If you have received this message in error, please notify the sender immediately and delete all copies of it. Thank 
you. 
 


