Mei Kwan (LKKAuto)

From: Rajes (LKK Auto)

Sent: Friday, 30 June 2023 11:14 AM

To: Motor Claims (Allianz Insurance Singapore); assignments; Admin A

Subject: RE: PRI; Accident on 23/06/2023 between SLX6165A & XE1927J(Ol) at/along Seletar
west link

Categories: HMK

Dear Sir /Mdm,

Thank you for the assignment.

Best Regards,
Rajes | Admin
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6741-8434 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Motor Claims (Allianz Insurance Singapore) <claims@allianz.com.sg>

Sent: Wednesday, June 28, 2023 5:13 PM

To: Advance Auto Garage <advanceag@hotmail.com>; assignments <assignments@Ikkauto.com>; Admin A <admin-
a@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: PRI; Accident on 23/06/2023 between SLX6165A & XE1927J(0l) at/along Seletar west link

Internal

Dear Sirs,
We hereby appoint our direct settlement partners LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd to conduct survey.
Kindly engage with them to arrange for survey.

Thank you.

Claims Specialist

Claims & Performance Management

Allianz Insurance Singapore Pte. Ltd. | UEN 201903913C
79 Robinson Road #09-01, Singapore 068897

www.allianz.sg

QQO | Altianz @) | (.~

Warldwide Olympic ond Perolymplc Portner

Please note: This e-mail and any files transmitted with it is intended only for the named recipients and may contain confidential and / or privileged
information. If you are not the intended recipient, please do not read, copy, use or disclose the contents of this communication to others and notify the
sender immediately. Then please delete the e-mail and any copies of it. Thank you.

& Please consider the environment before printing this e-mail.



From: Advance Auto Garage <advanceag@hotmail.com>

Sent: Tuesday, 27 June 2023 1:30 pm

To: Motor Claims (Allianz Insurance Singapore) <claims@allianz.com.sg>

Subject: [EXT] RE: PRI; Accident on 23/06/2023 between SLX6165A & XE1927) at/along Seletar west link

Dear Sirs,
We are agreeable to appoint LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd to conduct survey. Thank you.
Best Regards,

Xavier Lim

(+65) 9007 9247

Advance Auto Garage

23 Kaki Bukit Avenue 4, #04-01
Vicom Kaki Bukit Inspection Center
Singapore 415933

From: Motor Claims (Allianz Insurance Singapore) <claims@allianz.com.sg>

Sent: Tuesday, June 27, 2023 11:27 AM

To: Advance Auto Garage <advanceag@hotmail.com>

Subject: RE: PRI; Accident on 23/06/2023 between SLX6165A & XE1927) at/along Seletar west link

Internal
Without Prejudice
Dear Sir/Madam

Kindly provide us your client GIA report and LTA search fee.

iEncIosed is the list of surveyors for your consideration for Single Joint Expert (SJE):-

e AJAX Inspection Services Pte Ltd
e Form Team Consultancy Pte Ltd
e LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

e RT APPRAISAL PTE LTD

Please let us know who you are agreeable to appoint from the list.

Should you require any clarification or assistance, please do not hesitate to contact our Claims Department
at claims@allianz.com.sg

Thank you.

Claims Specialist
Claims & Performance Management

Allianz Insurance Singapore Pte. Ltd. | UEN 201903913C
79 Robinson Road #09-01, Singapore 068897

www.allianz.sg



QQO | Altianz @) | (.~

Warldwide Olympic ond Perolymplc Portner

Please note: This e-mail and any files transmitted with it is intended only for the named recipients and may contain confidential and / or privileged
information. If you are not the intended recipient, please do not read, copy, use or disclose the contents of this communication to others and notify the
sender immediately. Then please delete the e-mail and any copies of it. Thank you.

& Please consider the environment before printing this e-mail.

From: Advance Auto Garage <advanceag@hotmail.com>

Sent: Monday, 26 June 2023 12:52 pm

To: Motor Claims (Allianz Insurance Singapore) <claims@allianz.com.sg>

Subject: [EXT] PRI; Accident on 23/06/2023 between SLX6165A & XE1927] at/along Seletar west link

Our Ref: AAG. 20230612
Your Ref: XE1927)

PRE-REPAIR INSPECTION NOTICE

Dear Sirs,

We act for GOH YAW JYE, owner of SLX6165A that was damaged as a result of the above accident.
Please take note that our client's motorcar is presently located at his repairer's workshop,

Advance Auto Garage

23 Kaki Bukit Ave 4, #04-01
Vicom Kaki Bukit

Singapore 415933

TEL: 9007 9247

Email: advanceag@hotmail.com
ATTN: Xavier Lim

In the circumstances, kindly let us know within 2 (two) working days from your receipt of this Notice if you will be
conducting a pre-repair inspection of our client's vehicle.
For a direct and amicable settlement, kindly send us your panel of surveyors for us to choose from.

As provided by NIMA Protocol, take note that our client shall proceed to appoint his own surveyor and repair his vehicle
without any further reference to you, if we do not hear from you within the next 2 (two) days.

Best Regards,

Xavier Lim

(+65) 9007 9247

Advance Auto Garage

23 Kaki Bukit Avenue 4, #04-01
Vicom Kaki Bukit Inspection Center
Singapore 415933



