Meng Yan (LKK Auto)

From: Claims <claims@budgetdirect.com.sg>

Sent: Tuesday, 27 June 2023 3:25 pm

To: admin-d; SUR; assignments

Cc: Derrick Quok; Kenneth Lim; Don Bong; Ng Chen How

Subject: TPPD survey: Claim ref: C10023120 /CH || Ol- SGW1885C (White) TP-SJK423L || Est: $0.00 || KT Motorwerk
Attachments: C10023120 - TP (SJK423L).zip

Hi Team,

We would like to request TP survey for SJIK423L. TP chose LKK to survey the vehicle.
Our insured has yet to report the accident.

Workshop information:
Address:

KT MOTORWERK
ADD: Blk 3012 Bedok Industrial Park E, #01-2020 S4f

John Tee,

HD-O0907407

Please confirm assignment.
Thank you.
Warmest Regards,

Frauleine Khoo
Admin Executive, Claims

T +65 6989 3696
F +65 6725 0853
E frauleine.khoo@budgetdirect.com.sg
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From: John Tee <ktmotorwerk@hotmail.com>

Sent: Tuesday, June 27, 2023 3:11 PM

To: Claims <claims@budgetdirect.com.sg>

Subject: Re: PRI Request on 27.06.2023 || C10023120/CH || ACCIDENT INVOLVING SJK423L AND SGW1885C ALONG TPE TOWARDS CTE (CITY) ON 27.06.2023
on 0640HRS

Dear Team, we would like to appoint LKK.

Thank you.

Sent from my iPhone



From: John Tee <ktmotorwerk@hotmail.com>

Sent: Tuesday, June 27, 2023 2:57 PM

To: Claims <claims@budgetdirect.com.sg>

Subject: Re: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SJK423L AND SGW1885C ALONG TPE TOWARDS CTE (CITY) ON 27.06.2023 on 0640HRS

Dear Team,

Below is the attached GIA report.

Sent from my iPhone

On 27 Jun 2023, at 2:51 PM, Claims <claims@budgetdirect.com.sg> wrote:

Dear Sirs,

We refer to your survey request on even date.

Kindly let us have your client’s GIA Report for our claim registration.
Our insured has yet to report the accident.

Thank you.

Warmest Regards,

Frauleine Khoo
Admin Executive, Claims

T +65 6989 3696
F +65 6725 0853
E frauleine.khoo@budgetdirect.com.sg
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From: John Tee <ktmotorwerk@hotmail.com>

Sent: Tuesday, June 27, 2023 2:02 PM

To: Claims <claims@budgetdirect.com.sg>

Subject: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SJK423L AND SGW1885C ALONG TPE TOWARDS CTE (CITY) ON 27.06.2023 on 0640HRS

To the officer in charge,
We are the appointed workshop for SJK423L. The other party SGW1885C (BUDGET DIRECT)
Please arrange for inspection at the following address:

KT MOTORWERK
ADD: Blk 3012 Bedok Industrial Park E, #01-2020 S489978

Once the date and time is firm, please inform us and look for John Tee, 98287487 during the inspection.

Regards,
John Tee,



HP:98287487
KT MOTORWERK
ADD: Blk 3012 Bedok Industrial Park E, #01-2020 S489978



