Mei Kwan (LKKAuto)

From: Meng Yan (LKK Auto)

Sent: Tuesday, 27 June 2023 6:02 PM

To: Motor Claims (Allianz Insurance Singapore); Admin A; assignments

Cc: Rajes (LKK Auto)

Subject: RE: PRI - SKM5207P CLAIMING AGAINST GBL865J (ALLIANZ), DOA: 26/06/2023
Hi Allianz,

Thank you for the assignment.

For the efficiency of future assignment arrangement, we will highly appreciate if you could send to the email
address below:
assignments@Ilkkauto.com @ Phone: 6741-8434/ 6841-1972

Best Regards,
Yan | Admin
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6741-8434 / Whatsapp call: 87813698 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Motor Claims (Allianz Insurance Singapore) <claims@allianz.com.sg>

Sent: Tuesday, June 27, 2023 5:59 PM

To: Admin A <admin-a@Ikkauto.com>; Meng Yan (LKK Auto) <mengyan@Ikkauto.com>
Subject: RE: PRI - SKM5207P CLAIMING AGAINST GBL865J (ALLIANZ), DOA: 26/06/2023

Internal

Dear Survey Firm,

Please create claim in Merimen accordingly.
Insured non report as of today.

insurance082022 @gmail.com
+6587327064

Thank you

Janice Koh
Claims Specialist
Claims & Performance Management

Allianz Insurance Singapore Pte. Ltd. | UEN 201903913C
79 Robinson Road #09-01, Singapore 068897

www.allianz.sg



QQO | Altianz @) | (.~

Warldwide Olympic ond Perolymplc Portner

Please note: This e-mail and any files transmitted with it is intended only for the named recipients and may contain confidential and / or privileged
information. If you are not the intended recipient, please do not read, copy, use or disclose the contents of this communication to others and notify the
sender immediately. Then please delete the e-mail and any copies of it. Thank you.

& Please consider the environment before printing this e-mail.

From: Motor Claims (Allianz Insurance Singapore)

Sent: Tuesday, 27 June 2023 5:53 pm

To: 'Foo Song Jun' <songjun.foo@ow.sg>; Joseph Low <joseph@ow.sg>; Mohamed Nashik <mohamed.nashik@ow.sg>;
Ling Ting An <tingan.ling@ow.sg>; Victor Seng <victor.seng@ow.sg>

Cc: admin-a@lkkauto.com; Meng Yan (LKK Auto) <mengyan@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: PRI - SKM5207P CLAIMING AGAINST GBL865J (ALLIANZ), DOA: 26/06/2023

Internal
Dear Sirs,
We hereby appoint our direct settlement partners LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD to conduct survey.
Kindly engage with them to arrange for survey.

Thank you.

Claims Specialist

Claims & Performance Management

Allianz Insurance Singapore Pte. Ltd. | UEN 201903913C
79 Robinson Road #09-01, Singapore 068897

www.allianz.sg

QQO | Altianz @) | (.~

Warldwide Olympic ond Perolymplc Portner

Please note: This e-mail and any files transmitted with it is intended only for the named recipients and may contain confidential and / or privileged
information. If you are not the intended recipient, please do not read, copy, use or disclose the contents of this communication to others and notify the
sender immediately. Then please delete the e-mail and any copies of it. Thank you.

& Please consider the environment before printing this e-mail.

From: Foo Song Jun <songjun.foo@ow.sg>

Sent: Tuesday, 27 June 2023 11:18 am

To: Motor Claims (Allianz Insurance Singapore) <claims@allianz.com.sg>

Cc: Joseph Low <joseph@ow.sg>; Mohamed Nashik <mohamed.nashik@ow.sg>; Ling Ting An <tingan.ling@ow.sg>;
Victor Seng <victor.seng@ow.sg>

Subject: [EXT] PRI - SKM5207P CLAIMING AGAINST GBL865J (ALLIANZ), DOA: 26/06/2023

Dear Motor Claims Department,
Kindly arrange PRI at 10 Ang Mo Kio Industrial Park 2A #01-05 AMK Autopoint S568047.

*Vehicle is not in the workshop*



Thank you

Foo Song Jun (Mr.)
Motor Claims Officer
Office :(+65) 6481 1522

OPT/MANERHKZ pre.Lo.

Head Office: 159 Sin Ming Road, Amtech Building Lobby 2, #04-05 Singapore 575625 Tel: (+65) 6255 1339
Service Centre: 600 Sin Ming Avenue, CityCab Building, #03-00 Singapore 575733 Tel: (+65) 6472 1313
Motor Insurance Claims Centre: Blk 10 Ang Mo Kio Industrial Park 2A, #01-05/06 Singapore 568047 Tel: (+65) 6481 1522
Optima Carz Leasing: 159 Sin Ming Road, Amtech Building Lobby 2, #04-05 Singapore 575625

Tel: (+65) 6452 6868
www.ow.sg | www.facebook.com/OptimaWerkz

Privileged/Confidential information may be contained in this message. If you are not the intended recipient, you must not copy, distribute or use it for any purpose,
nor disclose its contents to any other person.

Please notify the sender if you receive this email in error, and delete the email and its content immediately after which.



