Mei Kwan (LKKAuto)

From: Rajes (LKK Auto)

Sent: Thursday, 22 June 2023 10:10 AM

To: Motor Claims (Allianz Insurance Singapore); Admin A

Cc: assignments

Subject: RE: GBL7524Y /TP PC6615G / DOA 21/06/2023 - CHECK LIABILITY
Categories: HMK

Dear Shanti,

Thank you for the assignment.

Best Regards,
Rajes | Admin
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6741-8434 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Motor Claims (Allianz Insurance Singapore) <claims@allianz.com.sg>

Sent: Wednesday, June 21, 2023 6:40 PM

To: Admin A <admin-a@Ikkauto.com>

Cc: admin-d <admin-d@lkkauto.com>; Taxis Customer Service <taxiscs@stengg.com>
Subject: FW: GBL7524Y / TP PC6615G / DOA 21/06/2023 - CHECK LIABILITY
Importance: High

Internal

Your ref: GBL7524Y

Our ref: PC6615G

Dear Sirs,

We hereby appoint our direct settlement partners LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD to conduct survey.

Kindly engage with them to arrange for survey.

Guang
Ding Automotive Pte Ltd



Hp : 93299929
Office : 62657130

File: PS.pdf

Link: https://filexchange.allianz.de/SecureDownload.aspx?id=582c4cb1-blac-4479-95bf-78b04d40df49-e3502dd17009440c

Size: ~ 0 MByte, Download available until: 6/26/2023
Thank you.

Best regards,

Shanti. R

Claims Service

Allianz Insurance Singapore Pte. Ltd. | UEN 201903913C
79 Robinson Road #09-01 | Singapore 068897

Phone: +65 6395 3836 | www.allianz.sg

OQP | Altianz @ |

This e-mail and any files transmitted with it is intended only for the named recipients and may contain confidential and /
or privileged information. If you are not the intended recipient, please do not read, copy, use or disclose the contents of
this communication to others and notify the sender immediately. Then please delete the e-mail and any copies of it.

Thank you.

P Please consider the environment before printing this e-mail.



From: Taxis Customer Service <taxiscs@stengg.com>

Sent: Wednesday, 21 June 2023 5:32 pm

To: Motor Claims (Allianz Insurance Singapore) <claims@allianz.com.sg>

Cc: claims@dingautomotive.com; Kelly Ding <kelly@dingautomotive.com>; sarah@dingautomotive.com
Subject: [EXT] GBL7524Y / TP PC6615G / DOA 21/06/2023 - CHECK LIABILITY

Importance: High

Without Prejudice
Dear Officer,

Please refer attachment.
Kindly advise liability for case as stated above our insured GBL7524Y claiming against your insured PC6615G.

Kindly revert back as soon as possible.

Thank You
Best Regards,

Guang

Ding Automotive Pte Ltd
Hp : 93299929

Office : 62657130

This email is confidential and may also be privileged. If this email has been sent to you in error, please delete it
immediately and notify us. Please do not copy, distribute, or disseminate part or whole of this email if you are not the
intended recipient or if you have not been authorized to do so. We reserve the right, to the extent and under
circumstances permitted by applicable laws, to retain, monitor, and intercept email messages to and from our systems.
Thank you.



