Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

From: edwin wong <edwin_wong82@hotmail.com>

Sent: Tuesday, 27 June 2023 9:57 AM

To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Subject: Re: CLAIM NOTIFICATION - ACCIDENT INVOLVING SFB6999Y(AIG) AND SNC7827D

AT/ALONG DUNEARN ROAD ON 17/06/2023

Dear Hsiao Tong,

Yes. From the car video footage, clearly the driver of SNC7827D did not STOP at the stipulated stop line.
Her car was clearly moving at all times until the point of contact with my vehicle.

Anyways, thank you for your help.

Rgds,
Edwin

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@Ikkauto.com>

Sent: Tuesday, June 27, 2023 9:51 AM

To: edwin wong <edwin_wong82@hotmail.com>

Subject: RE: CLAIM NOTIFICATION - ACCIDENT INVOLVING SFB6999Y(AIG) AND SNC7827D AT/ALONG DUNEARN
ROAD ON 17/06/2023

Dear Sirs,

Thank you for your email.

We have received a copy of your car video footage from AlG. We have reviewed and based on our claim assessment,
liability is down against third party.

In view of this, we will proceed to reject third party against your policy and close case.

No action is needed from your side.



Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742-3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com |

HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 |
S5(408933)

From: edwin wong <edwin_wong82@hotmail.com>

Sent: Monday, June 26, 2023 3:01 PM

To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@Ikkauto.com>

Subject: Re: CLAIM NOTIFICATION - ACCIDENT INVOLVING SFB6999Y(AIG) AND SNC7827D AT/ALONG DUNEARN
ROAD ON 17/06/2023

Dear Hsiao Tong,

Good day to you.

i thought C&C told me that the other party surveyor already accepted the liability?

Now SNC7827D is claiming against my insurance policy?

Cani know -

1. What is she trying to claim?
2. Based on what evidence is she trying to claim against my policy?
Thank you.



Rgds,
Edwin

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@Ikkauto.com>

Sent: Monday, June 26, 2023 2:18 PM

To: edwin wong82@hotmail.com <edwin wong82@hotmail.com>

Subject: CLAIM NOTIFICATION - ACCIDENT INVOLVING SFB6999Y(AIG) AND SNC7827D AT/ALONG DUNEARN ROAD
ON 17/06/2023

CONCORDE AUTO ACCESSORIES (S) PTE LTD [By Email Only]
DRIVER: WONG KAM WAN

Dear Sir/Madam,

You Ref: SFB6999Y
Our Ref: CC6/A1G23006190/Kpa3
ACCIDENT INVOLVING SFB6999Y(AIG) AND SNC7827D AT/ALONG DUNEARN ROAD ON 17/06/2023

We refer to the above subject matter. We write to inform you that we are the loss adjuster appointed by your motor
insurer, AlG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd. to deal with the third-party claim against your policy.

We have received a claim from SNC7827D against your insurance policy.

Pursuant to the above said accident wherein you and/or your authorized driver had amongst other information
given us your version of how the accident had occurred, we as the appointed agent of your insurers are looking into
the matter.

If you need any clarification, please do not hesitate to contact us.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742-3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com |

HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 |
S5(408933)




