Meng Yan (LKK Auto)

From: CHARMAINE KONG <charmainekong@lonpac.com>
Sent: Monday, 19 June 2023 2:16 pm

To: Albert Woo; assignments

Cc: MT_Claim_SG

Subject: RE: Your insurer vehicle No: GBH 6639 C

Lonpac External - General

Lonpac External - General

Ref: TBA

Without Prejudice

Dear Mr Tan,

Our insured had not reported the accident. We will appoint LKK to conduct the survey.
Aside to LKK - Attn : Meng Yan, FYNA please.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Charmaine Kong

Claims Officer | Lonpac Insurance Bhd

300 Beach Road, #17-04/06 The Concourse, Singapore 199555
Tel: (65) 6250 7388 Ext.268 | Fax: (65) 6296 2706

HEW . |onpac




We are committed to acting professionally, fairly and with integrity. We do not condone bribery, fraud or corrupt practices.

We are committed to acting professionally, fairly and with integrity. We do not condone bribery, fraud or corrupt practices.

From: Albert Woo <soonsanmotor@yahoo.com.sg>
Sent: Saturday, June 17, 2023 2:00 PM

To: MT_Claim_SG <mt_claim@Ilonpac.com>
Subject: Your insurer vehicle No: GBH 6639 C

Soon San Motor Trading

Blk 3006, Ubi Road 1, #01-390,
Singapore 408700

Tel : 68414445

Fax: 67473546

17th June 2023

Lonpac Insurance Bhd
300, Beach Road, #10-04,
The Concourse

Singapore 199555

Dear Sir/Mdm,
Accident involving ( SNG 3448 U, GBH 6639 C, YQ 889 R and JPE 8896 ) PIE towards Changi Airport Steven on 17/06/2023

We hereby give you two days notice for your surveyor to contact and inspection on the motor vehicle No : SNG 3448 U at the above address contact person ( Vincent H/P:
90047468 )direct settlement.

Your faithfully,

We are committed to acting professionally, fairly and with integrity. We do not condone bribery, fraud or corrupt practices.



