Mei Kwan (LKKAuto)

From: Rajes (LKK Auto)

Sent: Wednesday, June 14, 2023 11:42 AM

To: Motor Claims (Allianz Insurance Singapore); Admin A

Cc: assignments

Subject: RE: RE: ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLE SKV 186 B & YOUR INSURED SLZ 1241 K ON

10/6/2023 - TF

Dear Sir/Mdm,

Thank you for the assignment.

Best Regards,
Rajes | Admin
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6741-8434 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Motor Claims (Allianz Insurance Singapore) <claims@allianz.com.sg>

Sent: Tuesday, June 13, 2023 8:12 PM

To: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>

Cc: Claims <claims@premiumauto.com.sg>; admin-d <admin-d@Ilkkauto.com>

Subject: FW: RE: ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLE SKV 186 B & YOUR INSURED SLZ 1241 K ON 10/6/2023 - TF

Internal

From: Claims <claims@premiumauto.com.sg>

Sent: Tuesday, 13 June 2023 1:31 pm

To: Motor Claims (Allianz Insurance Singapore) <claims@allianz.com.sg>

Cc: claims@premiumauto.com.sg

Subject: [EXT] RE: ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLE SKV 186 B & YOUR INSURED SLZ 1241 K ON 10/6/2023 - TF

Dear Claims,

Attached above is the Estimate for your kind reference.
Kindly assist follow up direct settlement.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

En Qi Lim

Claims Adminstrator

Premium Automobiles Pte Ltd (reg No 199902271w)
55 Ubi Road 1 Road Singapore 408699
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From: Claims <claims@premiumauto.com.sg>

Sent: Monday, 12 June 2023 2:46 PM

To: claims@allianz.com.sg

Cc: claims@premiumauto.com.sg

Subject: ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLE SKV 186 B & YOUR INSURED SLZ 1241 K ON 10/6/2023 - TF

Dear all,

Kindly assist in the liability clearance for above mentioned case. We are in the opinion that our client is not the
proximate cause of the accident.

Therefore, we propose for direct settlement at 100% liability clearance in our clients favour.
Please advise who the officer in-charge we shall liaise with.

Attached are the GIA report for your reference and we will send you the estimate once it is ready.
Kindly arrange survey on 14/6/2023 @10am. 24 Benoi Sector, $629857. Vehicle In.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

En Qi Lim

Claims Adminstrator

Premium Automobiles Pte Ltd (reg No 199902271w)

55 Ubi Road 1 Road Singapore 408699
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