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Celine Fong (LKKAuto)

From: Michelle Tan <michelle.tan@genie.sg>
Sent: Tuesday, 13 June 2023 2:57 PM
To: Celine Fong (LKKAuto)
Cc: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto); LKK Valuation
Subject: Re: Valuation of COE Car

Hi Celine, 
 
Please send the invoice for us to prepare payment. 
 
Thank you! 
 
Best Regards, 
Michelle Tan  
9818 0672 | michelle.tan@genie.sg 
20 Sin Ming Lane #05-64 Midview City Singapore 573968 
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On Tue, Jun 13, 2023 at 9:53 AM Celine Fong (LKKAuto) <celinefong@lkkauto.com> wrote: 

Dear Michelle, 

  

The Valuation of vehicle as below: 

  

  

SLS 9408G           MV: $12,000.00              

  

As at June 2023. 

  

  

  

Best Regards, 

Celine Fong  
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LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

phone: 6256-3561 | email: celinefong@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

  

From: Michelle Tan <michelle.tan@genie.sg>  
Sent: Saturday, June 10, 2023 11:43 AM 
To: Celine Fong (LKKAuto) <celinefong@lkkauto.com> 
Cc: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto) <siewsc@lkkauto.com>; LKK Valuation <valuation@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: Re: Valuation of COE Car 

  

Dear team, 

  

Please assist with the desktop valuation of the vehicle as per attached logcard. 

  

Thank you! 

  
Best Regards, 
Michelle Tan  
9818 0672 | michelle.tan@genie.sg 
20 Sin Ming Lane #05-64 Midview City Singapore 573968 
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On Thu, Jun 8, 2023 at 7:16 PM Celine Fong (LKKAuto) <celinefong@lkkauto.com> wrote: 

Dear Michelle, 

  

The fee charge will be the same. 
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Best Regards, 

Celine Fong  

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

phone: 6256-3561 | email: celinefong@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

  

From: Michelle Tan <michelle.tan@genie.sg>  
Sent: Wednesday, June 7, 2023 2:33 PM 
To: Celine Fong (LKKAuto) <celinefong@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: Valuation of COE Car 

  

Dear Celine, 

  

Thank you for helping us with the valuation earlier!  

  

We have another car for valuation, but this time it's a COE car. Is there any difference in the pricing? 

  
Best Regards, 
Michelle Tan  
9818 0672 | michelle.tan@genie.sg 
20 Sin Ming Lane #05-64 Midview City Singapore 573968 
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