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Huey Yon (LKKAuto)

From: Kenneth Kong (LKKAuto)

Sent: Tuesday, 18 July 2023 5:21 PM

To: Huey Yon (LKKAuto)

Subject: FW: Resurvey B4 Paint _ SNH 363 U _ FINALIZATION

Attachments: 2711_001.pdf

 

 

From: Anikka Lai <anikkalai@honda.com.sg>  

Sent: Saturday, July 15, 2023 1:50 PM 

To: Kenneth Kong (LKKAuto) <KennethKong@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: RE: Resurvey B4 Paint _ SNH 363 U _ FINALIZATION 

 

Dear Kenneth, 

 

We enclosed the total final repair costs for, 

 

Vehicle No.   SNH363U 

Final Repair Costs (exclude GST)   $1,908.74 

Repair Period* (Days)   3 days 

*Note: Repair period does include Sunday and Public Holiday.es include Sunday and Public Holiday.ir period does 

include Sunday and Public Holiday. 

Please examine the above information carefully. If no discrepancy is reported within 7 days (exclude Sunday and 

Public Holiday) from the date of this email, the information will be considered as correct. Thereafter, no adjustment 

will be made. 

  

In addition, I have attached photos of before paint, ‘?’ items and supplementary parts (if any) for your records. 

 

Thank you. 

 

Best regards 

Anikka Lai 

Bodyshop Service Advisor 

(Mandai Bodyshop) 

 

Honda Singapore 

Kah Motor Co. Sdn Bhd 

6A Mandai Estate 

Singapore 729903 

DID : 65145248  HP: 82886302 

Web: www.honda.com.sg 

 

 

 

From: Anikka Lai  

Sent: Tuesday, June 27, 2023 10:11 AM 

To: Kenneth Kong (LKKAuto) <kennethkong@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: FW: Resurvey B4 Paint _ SNH 363 U 

 

Dear Kenneth, 

 

Attached for your action, please. 
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Thank you. 

 

Best regards 

Anikka Lai 

Bodyshop Service Advisor 

(Mandai Bodyshop) 

 

Honda Singapore 

Kah Motor Co. Sdn Bhd 

6A Mandai Estate 

Singapore 729903 

DID : 65145248  HP: 82886302 

Web: www.honda.com.sg 

 

 

 

 

From: Cheah Ai Nee <ancheah@honda.com.sg>  

Sent: Tuesday, June 27, 2023 10:07 AM 

To: Anikka Lai <anikkalai@honda.com.sg> 

Cc: Leon Lim <leonlim@honda.com.sg>; Jimmy Goh <jimmygoh@honda.com.sg>; Desmond Toh 

<desmondtoh@honda.com.sg>; Raymond Yeo <ncyeo@honda.com.sg>; Tay Ah Cheng <actay@honda.com.sg>; 

Wong Chi Chien <ccwong@honda.com.sg> 

Subject: Resurvey B4 Paint _ SNH 363 U 

 

Dear Anikka, 

 

Please refer to the above aFached. 

Kindly assist. 

 

Thank you. 

 

 

Best Regards, 
Cheah Ai Nee 
Storekeeper 
Mandai Body Repair & Paint 

 

Honda Singapore 

Kah Motor Co. Sdn. Bhd. 
8 Mandai Estate, Singapore 729905 
DID/Mobile: 65145268  
Web: www.honda.com.sg 
 

           

 

 

Confidential Note: The information contained in this email is intended only for the use of the 

individual or entity named above and may contain information that is privileged, confidential and 

exempt from disclosure under applicable law. If the reader of this message is not the intended 

recipient, you are hereby notified that any dissemination, distribution or copying of this 
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communication is strictly prohibited. If you have received this message in error, please immediately 

notify the sender and delete the mail. Thank you. 


