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Rajes (LKK Auto)

From: Motor Claims (Allianz Insurance Singapore) <claims@allianz.com.sg>
Sent: Wednesday, 14 June 2023 6:41 PM
To: Bozy Lu; Admin A
Cc: Emily Tan; Colin Tay; admin-d
Subject: FW: Claimant: Goh Yong Huang | Request for Pre-Repair Inspection | ACCIDENT 

INVOLVING FBH2074H (OUR CLIENT) & SML1135X (YOUR INSURED) ON 2/4/2023 
ALONG GAMBAS AVENUE

Internal 
 
Your Ref: FBH2074H 
Our Ref:  2023 32006812FR-GK-SML1135X 
 
Dear  LKK  
  
We are appointing your good office as the SJE for the PRI of   FBH2074H 
  
   
Please be informed that said vehicle can be inspected at: 
  
Venue: KM+ Motor Address: 61 Woodlands Industrial Park E9, Premier 9S #01-21, (S) 757047 
Contact: Mr. Ah Boi (Tel: 9635 3598 
   
Please download the documents from this link below (For Survey) 

 File: SML1135X OI REVISED.pdf, FBH2074H(TP).pdf 

Link: https://filexchange.allianz.de/SecureDownload.aspx?id=c8b155c7-ec2b-41f4-ad59-8a01ecc00aad-22cb5b0932e7ec66 

Size: ~ 1 MByte, Download available until: 6/19/2023 
  
Passwords will be sent in a separate email 
  
Best regards, 
  
Shanti.R 
Claims Service 
Claims & Performance Management 
  
Allianz Insurance Singapore Pte.Ltd. | UEN 201903913C  
79 Robinson Road #09-01 Singapore 068897  
Phone: +65 63958973 | www.allianz.sg 
 
 

 
 

From: Bozy Lu <bozy@hoh.com.sg>  
Sent: Wednesday, 14 June 2023 2:03 pm 
To: Motor Claims (Allianz Insurance Singapore) <claims@allianz.com.sg> 
Cc: Emily Tan <emily@hoh.com.sg>; Colin Tay <colin@hoh.com.sg> 
Subject: [EXT] RE: Claimant: Goh Yong Huang | Request for Pre-Repair Inspection | ACCIDENT INVOLVING FBH2074H 
(OUR CLIENT) & SML1135X (YOUR INSURED) ON 2/4/2023 ALONG GAMBAS AVENUE 
 
Dear Sirs,  
 
We would be agreeable to the appointment of whichever surveyor who is able to do the inspection at the 
earliest possible date.  
 
Thank you.  
 
Yours Faithfully, 
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Bozy Lu 
Advocate & Solicitor 

       
Blk 934 Yishun Central 1 
#03-53 Singapore 760934 
DID : (65) 6852 2341 
Fax : (65) 6755 8308 
Website: www.hoh.com.sg 
 
Incorporated in Singapore with limited liability 
(Registration No. 200302898Z) 
 
========================================================== 
Information in this message is confidential and may be legally privileged. It is intended solely for the person to whom it is addressed. Any 
review, dissemination or other use of, or commencement of any action in reliance upon this information by persons other than the intended 
recipient is prohibited. If you are not the intended recipient, please notify the sender and delete the message and any other record of it from 
your system immediately. 
 
Important Note to Clients: 
There has been a recent spate of email scams in financial transactions. Please call us for confirmation if you have received any request 
purportedly from our lawyers or staff to transfer funds or payment by any electronic means (eg. via telegraphic transfer or internet bank transfer 
etc). Thank you. 
 

From: Motor Claims (Allianz Insurance Singapore) <claims@allianz.com.sg>  
Sent: Tuesday, June 13, 2023 5:15 PM 
To: Bozy Lu <bozy@hoh.com.sg> 
Cc: Emily Tan <emily@hoh.com.sg>; Colin Tay <colin@hoh.com.sg> 
Subject: FW: Claimant: Goh Yong Huang | Request for Pre-Repair Inspection | ACCIDENT INVOLVING FBH2074H 
(OUR CLIENT) & SML1135X (YOUR INSURED) ON 2/4/2023 ALONG GAMBAS AVENUE 
 

Internal 
 
 
Your Ref: FBH2074H 
Our Ref:  2023 32006812FR-GK-SML1135X 
  
Dear Sirs 
  
Enclosed is the list of surveyors for your consideration for Single Joint Expert (SJE):- 
  

 AJAX InspecƟon Services Pte Ltd 
 Form Team  Consultancy  Pte Ltd 
 LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd    
 RT APPRIASAL PTE LTD 

  
Please let us know who you are agreeable to appoint from the list. 
  
Best regards, 
  
  
   Shanti. R 
   Claims Service  
   Allianz Insurance Singapore Pte. Ltd. | UEN 201903913C 
   79 Robinson Road #09-01 I Singapore 068897 
   Phone: +65 6395 3836 | www.allianz.sg 
  
    

 
  
  
    This e-mail and any files transmitted with it is intended only for the named recipients and may contain confidential and /   
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    or privileged information. If you are not the intended recipient, please do not read, copy, use or disclose the contents of  
    this communication to others and notify the sender immediately. Then please delete the e-mail and any copies of it.    
    Thank you. 
  
 
 
 

From: Bozy Lu <bozy@hoh.com.sg>  
Sent: Monday, 12 June 2023 10:22 am 
To: Motor Claims (Allianz Insurance Singapore) <claims@allianz.com.sg> 
Cc: Emily Tan <emily@hoh.com.sg>; Colin Tay <colin@hoh.com.sg> 
Subject: [EXT] Claimant: Goh Yong Huang | Request for Pre-Repair Inspection | ACCIDENT INVOLVING FBH2074H 
(OUR CLIENT) & SML1135X (YOUR INSURED) ON 2/4/2023 ALONG GAMBAS AVENUE 
 
Dear Sirs, 
 
NOTICE TO INSURER TO CONDUCT PRE-REPAIR INSPECTION  
ACCIDENT INVOLVING FBH2074H (OUR CLIENT) & SML1135X (YOUR INSURED) ON 2/4/2023 ALONG GAMBAS 
AVENUE 
 
We refer to the above matter, wherein we act for Mr Goh Yong Huang. 
 
Kindly find attached our letter of even date for your immediate attention.  
 
Thank you.  
 
Yours Faithfully, 
Bozy Lu 
Advocate & Solicitor 

       
Blk 934 Yishun Central 1 
#03-53 Singapore 760934 
DID : (65) 6852 2341 
Fax : (65) 6755 8308 
Website: www.hoh.com.sg 
 
Incorporated in Singapore with limited liability 
(Registration No. 200302898Z) 
 
========================================================== 
Information in this message is confidential and may be legally privileged. It is intended solely for the person to whom it is addressed. Any 
review, dissemination or other use of, or commencement of any action in reliance upon this information by persons other than the intended 
recipient is prohibited. If you are not the intended recipient, please notify the sender and delete the message and any other record of it from 
your system immediately. 
 
Important Note to Clients: 
There has been a recent spate of email scams in financial transactions. Please call us for confirmation if you have received any request 
purportedly from our lawyers or staff to transfer funds or payment by any electronic means (eg. via telegraphic transfer or internet bank transfer 
etc). Thank you. 

 


