Huey Yon (LKKAuto)

From: Christina Low <superzeemotor@gmail.com>
Sent: Friday, 4 August 2023 10:10 AM

To: Taufikh (LKKAuto)

Cc: Huey Yon (LKKAuto)

Subject: Re: SJA 2323G FINALISE

Dear Mr Taufikh

We thank you for your email and confirm acceptance of your recommendation of $$3,000.00 for repair cost and 4
days loss of use for the said claim.

Regards

Christina Low

Super-Zee Motor Service
Tel: 63831913
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On Thu, Aug 3, 2023 at 4:18 PM Taufikh (LKKAuto) <Taufikh@lkkauto.com> wrote:

> Please refer attached, COR L/S $3000, 4 days.
>

>

>

> Subject to insurance approval.
>

>

>

> Regards

>

> Taufikh

>

> Lkk Auto

>

>



