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EzLyna (LKKAuto)

From: EzLyna (LKKAuto)
Sent: Thursday, 27 July 2023 3:14 pm
To: feliciateo19@gmail.com
Cc: Admin A
Subject: RE: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SKC1525A (ALLIANZ) AND SNH7674B AT/ALONG 

ANCHORVALE ROAD TOWARDS TUAS ON 27/05/2023

Dear Felicia, 
 
We refer to the above maƩer. 
 
We have obtained Allianz’s approval to seƩle third party claim.  Thank you. 
 
With warmest regards, 
Ezlyna 
 

From: EzLyna (LKKAuto)  
Sent: Tuesday, June 27, 2023 8:24 AM 
To: 'feliciateo19@gmail.com' <feliciateo19@gmail.com> 
Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: RE: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SKC1525A (ALLIANZ) AND SNH7674B AT/ALONG ANCHORVALE ROAD TOWARDS 
TUAS ON 27/05/2023 
 
Dear Teo Hwee Leng Felicia, 
 
We refer to our email below. 
 
My apologies for the typo error, the correct third party’s vehicle number should be SNH7674B.  Thank you. 
 
With warmest regards, 
Ezlyna  
 

From: EzLyna (LKKAuto)  
Sent: Tuesday, June 27, 2023 8:20 AM 
To: feliciateo19@gmail.com 
Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SKC1525A (ALLIANZ) AND SNH7674B AT/ALONG ANCHORVALE ROAD TOWARDS TUAS 
ON 27/05/2023 
 
Dear Teo Hwee Leng Felicia, 
 
You Ref: SKC1525A 
Our Ref: CC4/AIS23005966/Uya3 
ACCIDENT INVOLVING SKC1525A (ALLIANZ) AND SNH7474B AT/ALONG ANCHORVALE ROAD TOWARDS TUAS ON 
27/05/2023 
 



2

We refer to the above subject matter.  We write to inform you that we are the loss adjuster appointed by your motor 
insurer, Allianz Insurance Singapore Pte. Ltd to deal with the third party claim against your policy. 
 
We have received a claim from SNH7674B against your insurance policy. 
                
Based on the accident report and accident scenario, we are of the view that liability is not in your favour. Therefore, we 
shall proceed to negotiate for an amicable settlement of the third-party claim at best to avoid further litigation, which 
would escalate to even more cost.  
  
Please be informed that your No Claim Discount (NCD) may be affected as a result of the claim against your policy. 
 
As Insurers, they shall proceed to deal with the claim(s) subject to the merits of the case and according to the rights 
afforded under the policy. Should you not be seeking the protection of your policy and seek to take conduct of third party 
claim(s) arising from this incident, at your own cost and defence, please reply to us within 7 days from the date of this 
letter. Your intent must be formally expressed to Allianz and acknowledged by Allianz. 
 
To protect your interest(s) in the handling of this claim, please do not discuss liability with any of the Third Party(s) and/or 
their legal representatives, or make any compromise or settlement without our prior knowledge and consent. If you 
receive any correspondence or legal document such as a Writ of Summons in connection with this accident, please 
forward it to us immediately. You may email it to customerservice@allianz.com.sg or deliver it by hand to Allianz Customer 
Care Centre. 
 
This letter should not be regarded as a waiver by Allianz of their rights to repudiate any claim because of any breach of 
policy terms and conditions you and/or your authorised driver may have committed. 
 
In the event of receiving and handling of any third-party injury claim(s), we shall keep you informed of the final indemnity 
upon conclusion of the matter(s).  
  
If you need any clarification, please do not hesitate to contact me.  Thank you. 
 
*I am working from home till 07.07.2023.  If you wish to contact me, pls whatsapp call at 80287880 or email. 

 

Best Regards, 

Ezlyna Eng | Case Handler   

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

phone: 6841-6051 | email: Ezlyna@lkkauto.com |  

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 
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EzLyna (LKKAuto)

From: admin2@jssmautosolutions.com
Sent: Monday, 24 July 2023 4:53 pm
To: EzLyna (LKKAuto)
Cc: motorclaims@jssmautosolutions.com; sean@jssmautosolutions.com; 

shien@jssmautosolutions.com; admin1@jssmautosolutions.com
Subject: RE: E-VOUCHER / OFFER / LETTER OF DEMAND (LOD) for accident between SNH7674B 

& SKC1525A DOA: 27.05.2023
Attachments: Letter of Authorization SNH7674B.pdf

‘WITHOUT PREJUDICE’ 
 
Dear Ezlyna, 
 
We have reviewed the offer and we are pleased to accept it. 

Please inform me if you require more documents for this case. 
 
If not please process the payment to us as follows : 
 
Bank account details 

Account Name: JSSM AUTOSOLUTIONS PTE LTD 

Paynow: 202012242C 

Bank Name: United Overseas Bank (UOB) 

Bank Account No.: 388-321-141-1 

Bank Branch: JEM 

Bank Code: 336 

Swift Code: UOVBSGSG 

Cheque Mail to: Block 8 Kaki Bukit Avenue 4 #02-13 Premier @ Kaki Bukit 
(S) 415875  
 

 
Thank you. 
 
“ The contents of this email apply to vehicle damages only. All personal injuries and damages arising 
therefrom are excluded from the ambit and application of this email.” 
 
 
Motor Claims Department  
JSSM AUTOSOLUTIONS PTE LTD [HQ] 
8 KAKI BUKIT AVENUE 4 #02-13 
PREMIER@KAKI BUKIT S(415875) 
Mobile: (65) 9027 9220 
Email: admin2@jssmautosolutions.com 
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WORKSHOP ADDRESS: 
No. 8 Kaki Bukit Ave 4  
 Premier@Kaki Bukit #02-13 
Singapore 415875 
 
 

From: "EzLyna (LKKAuto)" <ezlyna@lkkauto.com> 
Date: Monday, 24 July 2023 at 11:57 AM 
To: Lim Jonathan <motorclaims@jssmautosolutions.com> 
Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: RE: E-VOUCHER / OFFER / LETTER OF DEMAND (LOD) for accident between SNH7674B & SKC1525A 
DOA: 27.05.2023 
 
‘WITHOUT PREJUDICE’ 
  SAVE AS TO COSTS 
 
Dear Sirs, 
 
Solely for purposes of amicable settlement, we are agreeable to resolve the matter at S$3,126.75 (all in) in full and final 
settlement of all claims your client has or may have against Allianz Insurance Singapore and/or their insured arising out 
of this incident.  
 
If the above offer is accepted, kindly confirm settlement by providing a copy of the Letter of Authorization / Warrant to 
Act  and your Bank details for us to process payment.   
 
Please note that your client’s receipt of the settlement sum or settlement sums shall constitute a full discharge of 
liability and waiver of any past, present or future claims your client may have against Allianz Insurance Singapore and/or 
our insured as a result of the accident on 27-May-2023.  
 
Please note that the clearance of this cheque / settlement sum or receipt of the successful electronic payment or 
payments constitutes your client’s acceptance of payment and full discharge of liability. 
 
*Kindly provide BANK DETAILS to effect payment. 
 
Thank you.  
 
Warmest Regards,  
Ezlyna 
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 
 
is intended only for the named recipients and may contain confidential and / or privileged information. If you are not 
the intended recipient, please do not read, copy, use or disclose the contents of this communication to others and 
notify the sender immediately. Then please delete the e-mail and any copies of it. Thank you. 
 
 

From: Lim Jonathan <motorclaims@jssmautosolutions.com>  
Sent: Monday, July 24, 2023 11:30 AM 
To: EzLyna (LKKAuto) <ezlyna@lkkauto.com> 
Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; sean@jssmautosolutions.com; shien@jssmautosolutions.com; 
admin1@jssmautosolutions.com; admin2@jssmautosolutions.com 
Subject: Re: OFFER / LETTER OF DEMAND (LOD) for accident between SNH7674B & SKC1525A DOA: 27.05.2023 
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Good day, 
 
Its been 2 weeks. We are just following up on the discharge voucher (DV) for this case as we would like to 
quickly close this case without any delay  
 
Thanks! 
 
Motor Claims Department 
H/P: (+65) 9126 9987 
Email: Motorclaims@jssmautosolutions.com 
Pre-REPAIR INSPECTION ADDRESS: 
No. 8 Kaki Bukit Ave 4 @ Premier @02-13 
Singapore 415875 
 

 
| No.8 Kaki Bukit @ Premier #03-41/42/27, #02-13, #01-54 Singapore 415874  
Office: +65 6748 1141 | Fax: +65 67491141  
 

From: "EzLyna (LKKAuto)" <ezlyna@lkkauto.com> 
Date: Monday, 17 July 2023 at 11:07 AM 
To: Lim Jonathan <motorclaims@jssmautosolutions.com> 
Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: RE:OFFER / LETTER OF DEMAND (LOD) for accident between SNH7674B & SKC1525A DOA: 
27.05.2023 
 
Without Prejudice 
 
Dear Jonathan, 
 
We refer to the above matter. 
 
We have our principal’s instruction to offer as follows:- 
 

1. Cost of Repair  $ 2,500.00 
2. Loss of Rental (4 days x $130) $    520.00 
3. LTA/GIA Search Fee $      26.75   
4. Towing Fee $      80.00 

Total $ 3,126.75 
 
*Date of Accident 27.05.2023, date of appointment from Allianz to conduct PRI on 12.06.2023 and PRI inspected on 
14.06.2023.  There is no delay to conduct PRI by either Allianz for LKK.   
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**Based on damages photo & estimate submitted, vehicle does not require towing but for an amicable settlement, our 
principal’s offer $80.00 for this case. 
 
Kindly confirm acceptance, E-voucher will follow shortly.  Thank you. 
 
With warmest regards, 
Ezlyna 
 

From: EzLyna (LKKAuto)  
Sent: Wednesday, July 5, 2023 11:15 AM 
To: Lim Jonathan <motorclaims@jssmautosolutions.com> 
Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: RE: LETTER OF DEMAND (LOD) for accident between SNH7674B & SKC1525A DOA: 27.05.2023 
 
Dear Jonathan, 
 
We refer to your email below. 
 
LOD received with thanks. 
 
With warmest regards, 
Ezlyna  
 

From: Lim Jonathan <motorclaims@jssmautosolutions.com>  
Sent: Tuesday, July 4, 2023 3:51 PM 
To: EzLyna (LKKAuto) <ezlyna@lkkauto.com> 
Cc: 'admin1@jssmautosolutions.com' <admin1@jssmautosolutions.com>; admin2@jssmautosolutions.com; 
'sean@jssmautosolutions.com' <sean@jssmautosolutions.com>; 'shien@jssmautosolutions.com' 
<shien@jssmautosolutions.com> 
Subject: Re: LETTER OF DEMAND (LOD) for accident between SNH7674B & SKC1525A DOA: 27.05.2023 
 
Take note the Reference number mistake. 
 
230527-TPC-JSSM14-SNH7674B 
 
 
Motor Claims Department 
H/P: (+65) 9126 9987 
Email: Motorclaims@jssmautosolutions.com 
Pre-REPAIR INSPECTION ADDRESS: 
No. 8 Kaki Bukit Ave 4 @ Premier @02-13 
Singapore 415875 
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| No.8 Kaki Bukit @ Premier #03-41/42/27, #02-13, #01-54 Singapore 415874  
Office: +65 6748 1141 | Fax: +65 67491141  
 

From: Lim Jonathan <motorclaims@jssmautosolutions.com> 
Date: Tuesday, 4 July 2023 at 3:28 PM 
To: <Ezlyna@lkkauto.com> 
Cc: "'admin1@jssmautosolutions.com'" <admin1@jssmautosolutions.com>, 
<admin2@jssmautosolutions.com>, "'sean@jssmautosolutions.com'" <sean@jssmautosolutions.com>, 
"'shien@jssmautosolutions.com'" <shien@jssmautosolutions.com> 
Subject: RE: LETTER OF DEMAND (LOD) for accident between SNH7674B & SKC1525A DOA: 27.05.2023 
 
WITHOUT PREJUDICE, 
  
Your REF: TO BE ADVISED 
Our REF: 230211-TPC-JSSM07-SMW4341P 
 
Good day Ezlyna, 
 
I hope my email find you well.  
 
Attached you will find the LOD of the above mention claim case. In effort to resolve and settle this matter directly save as 
to further cost. We are looking to hear an offer from you in reference to the finalised cost we have made with your 
appointed Surveyor. 
 
Please kindly get back to me soonest. I thank you for your assistance on this matter ѡѢѣѤ 
 
 
Motor Claims Department 
H/P: (+65) 9126 9987 
Email: Motorclaims@jssmautosolutions.com 
Pre-REPAIR INSPECTION ADDRESS: 
No. 8 Kaki Bukit Ave 4 @ Premier @02-13 
Singapore 415875 
 

 
| No.8 Kaki Bukit @ Premier #03-41/42/27, #02-13, #01-54 Singapore 415874  
Office: +65 6748 1141 | Fax: +65 67491141  


	5b4b7e020baf5199e254df66da4789fbb5d3e067fcfbed27073e9b13c0011f2c.pdf
	Microsoft Outlook - Memo Style
	5b4b7e020baf5199e254df66da4789fbb5d3e067fcfbed27073e9b13c0011f2c.pdf

