Mei Kwan (LKKAuto)

From: Rajes (LKK Auto)

Sent: Monday, 12 June 2023 4:04 PM

To: Motor Claims (Allianz Insurance Singapore); Admin A

Cc: assignments

Subject: RE: RE: REQUEST PRE-REPAIR INSPECTION OF SKC1525A (ALLIANZ) & SNH7674B

AT/ALONG JUNCTION OF SENGKANG EAST RD & ANCHORVALE ST ON 27/05/2023 AT
19:10 (SGT) [OUR REF: 230527-TPC-JSSM14-SNH7674B]

Follow Up Flag: Follow up
Flag Status: Flagged
Categories: HMK
Dear Shanti,

Thank you for the assignment.
Repairer arrange survey on 13/06/2023.

Best Regards,
Rajes | Admin
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6741-8434 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Motor Claims (Allianz Insurance Singapore) <claims@allianz.com.sg>

Sent: Monday, June 12, 2023 3:37 PM

To: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>

Cc: admin-d <admin-d@lkkauto.com>

Subject: FW: RE: REQUEST PRE-REPAIR INSPECTION OF SKC1525A (ALLIANZ) & SNH7674B AT/ALONG JUNCTION OF
SENGKANG EAST RD & ANCHORVALE ST ON 27/05/2023 AT 19:10 (SGT) [OUR REF: 230527-TPC-JSSM14-SNH7674B]

Internal

Your ref: SNH7674B
Our ref: 2023 32008887FR-SKC1525A

Dear Sirs,
We hereby appoint our direct settlement partners LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD to conduct survey.
Kindly engage with them to arrange for survey.

Motor Claims Department
JSSM AUTOSOLUTIONS PTE LTD [HQ]



adminl @jssmautosolutions.com

WORKSHOP ADDRESS:

Thank you.

Best regards,

Shanti. R

Claims Service

Allianz Insurance Singapore Pte. Ltd. | UEN 201903913C
79 Robinson Road #09-01 | Singapore 068897

Phone: +65 6395 3836 | www.allianz.sg

OQP | Altianz @ |

This e-mail and any files transmitted with it is intended only for the named recipients and may contain confidential and /
or privileged information. If you are not the intended recipient, please do not read, copy, use or disclose the contents of
this communication to others and notify the sender immediately. Then please delete the e-mail and any copies of it.
Thank you.

&2 Please consider the environment before printing this e-mail.

From: adminl @jssmautosolutions.com <adminl@jssmautosolutions.com>

Sent: Monday, 12 June 2023 1:26 pm

To: Motor Claims (Allianz Insurance Singapore) <claims@allianz.com.sg>

Cc: 'Lim Jonathan' <motorclaims(@)jssmautosolutions.com>; shien@jssmautosolutions.com

Subject: [EXT] RE: REQUEST PRE-REPAIR INSPECTION OF SKC1525A (ALLIANZ) & SNH7674B
AT/ALONG JUNCTION OF SENGKANG EAST RD & ANCHORVALE ST ON 27/05/2023 AT 19:10
(SGT) [OUR REF: 230527-TPC-JSSM14-SNH7674B]

Hi Dear Sir / Mdm,

We have yet to receive any instruction on when the surveyor is coming down for the pre repair inspection or
rather the SJE list for PRI. As I have attached the requested GIA report and LTA search on 07 June 2023.
Please kindly make arrangement for PRI as accident vehicle is brought in since 1% email sent to you
respectively.

Please do kindly advise on the next steps.



Motor Claims Department
JSSM AUTOSOLUTIONS PTE LTD [HQ]

adminl @jssmautosolutions.com

WORKSHOP ADDRESS:

From: admin@)jssmautosolutions.com <admin I @jssmautosolutions.com>

Sent: Wednesday, 7 June 2023 10:29 pm

To: 'Motor Claims (Allianz Insurance Singapore)' <claims@allianz.com.sg>

Cc: 'Lim Jonathan' <motorclaims@)jssmautosolutions.com>; 'shien@jssmautosolutions.com'
<shien@jssmautosolutions.com>

Subject: RE: REQUEST PRE-REPAIR INSPECTION OF SKC1525A (ALLIANZ) & SNH7674B
AT/ALONG JUNCTION OF SENGKANG EAST RD & ANCHORVALE ST ON 27/05/2023 AT 19:10
(SGT) [OUR REF: 230527-TPC-JSSM14-SNH7674B]

Hi Sir / Mdm,

I have attached the GIA report and LTA search upon request. Please kindly make arrangement for PRI of my
client’s vehicle as its in our workshop premises currently. Thank you and good day.

Motor Claims Department
JSSM AUTOSOLUTIONS PTE LTD [HQ]

adminl @jssmautosolutions.com

WORKSHOP ADDRESS:

From: Motor Claims (Allianz Insurance Singapore) <claims@allianz.com.sg>

Sent: Wednesday, 7 June 2023 6:07 pm

To: admin @jssmautosolutions.com

Cc: 'Lim Jonathan' <motorclaims(@)jssmautosolutions.com>; shien@jssmautosolutions.com

Subject: RE: REQUEST PRE-REPAIR INSPECTION OF SKC1525A (ALLIANZ) & SNH7674B
AT/ALONG JUNCTION OF SENGKANG EAST RD & ANCHORVALE ST ON 27/05/2023 AT 19:10
(SGT) [OUR REF: 230527-TPC-JSSM14-SNH7674B]

Internal

Dear Sir/Madam



Kindly provide us your client's GIA report and the LTA search.
Thank you.

Should you require any clarification or assistance, please do not hesitate to contact our Claims Department at
claims@allianz.com.sg

Best regards,

Shanti. R

Claims Service

Allianz Insurance Singapore Pte. Ltd. | UEN 201903913C
79 Robinson Road #09-01 | Singapore 068897

Phone: +65 6395 3836 | www.allianz.sg

OQ | Altianz @ |

This e-mail and any files transmitted with it is intended only for the named recipients and may contain confidential and /
or privileged information. If you are not the intended recipient, please do not read, copy, use or disclose the contents of
this communication to others and notify the sender immediately. Then please delete the e-mail and any copies of it.

From: adminl @)jssmautosolutions.com <adminl @jssmautosolutions.com>

Sent: Wednesday, 7 June 2023 1:44 pm

To: Motor Claims (Allianz Insurance Singapore) <claims@allianz.com.sg>

Cc: 'Lim Jonathan' <motorclaims(@)jssmautosolutions.com>; shien@jssmautosolutions.com

Subject: [EXT] REQUEST PRE-REPAIR INSPECTION OF SKC1525A (ALLIANZ) & SNH7674B
AT/ALONG JUNCTION OF SENGKANG EAST RD & ANCHORVALE ST ON 27/05/2023 AT 19:10
(SGT) [OUR REF: 230527-TPC-JSSM14-SNH7674B]

Your Ref: SKC1525A
Our Ref: 230527-TPC-JSSM14-SNH7674B

To whom it may concern,

We act for LOW MANCAI ALEX the owner SNH7674B ( MERCEDES / GLC250 4MATIC COUPE AMG LINE
[R19 LED] ) which was involved in the above captioned accident.

We are instructed by our client that the accident was caused by the negligence of the driver of
motor vehicle no. SKC1525A.

Our search shows that you are insurers of the motor vehicle no. SKC1525A, We are putting effort in align with the
insurers to direct settle save as to cost.

We are requested to inform you that our client’s vehicle is available for pre-repair inspection at the following address:

=

M/s JSSM AUTOSOLUTIONS PTE LTD
8 Kaki Bukit Avenue 4



#02-13 Premier@Kaki Bukit
Singapore 415875

Please request your assessor to contact our Mr. DERRICK ENG of JSSM AUTOSOLUTIONS PTE LTD at mobile
no.8666 9659 within forty-eight (48) hours from the receipt of this fax to arrange for the inspection.

Motor Claims Department
JSSM AUTOSOLUTIONS PTE LTD [HQ]

adminl @jssmautosolutions.com

WORKSHOP ADDRESS:



