Meng Yan (LKK Auto)

From: Claims <claims@budgetdirect.com.sg>

Sent: Monday, 12 June 2023 3:33 pm

To: admin-d; SUR; assignments

Cc: Derrick Quok; Kenneth Lim; Don Bong; Shafawati Bte Md Rabu

Subject: TPPD survey: Claim ref: C10022791 /SR || Ol- SMY7739X (White) TP-SLJ5849R|| Est: $13,566.80 || Hui Yang Motor PL
Attachments: C10022791 - TP (SLJ5849R).zip

Importance: High

Hi Team,

We would like to request TP survey for SLI5849R. TP chose LKK to survey the vehicle.

Workshop information:
Address:

kR E R R 2
HUI YANG MOTOR PTE. L~

Comntact Add : SIN MING AUTOCARE Blk 176 Sin Ming Drive #04-02 Si
Tel: 64515752 (2 Lines) . Fax: 64514658

Please confirm assignment.
Thank you.
Warmest Regards,

Frauleine Khoo
Admin Executive, Claims

T +65 6989 3696
F +65 6725 0853
E frauleine.khoo@budgetdirect.com.sg
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From: Hui Yang Motor <hui_yang_motor@hotmail.com>

Sent: Monday, June 12, 2023 2:30 PM

To: Claims <claims@budgetdirect.com.sg>

Subject: Re: PRI Request on 12.06.2023 || C10022791/SR || Survey for SLJI5849R / DOA: 11/06/2023
Importance: High

Hi Frauleine,

Our choice of surveyor is LKK.



Warm regards,
Bel

Tel: 64515752

From: Hui Yang Motor <hui_yang motor@hotmail.com>
Sent: Monday, June 12, 2023 1:20 PM

To: Claims <claims@budgetdirect.com.sg>

Subject: Survey for SLJ5849R / DOA: 11/06/2023

Dear Sir/Mdm,

Please refer to the attached estimate then help us arrange the survey as soon as possible. (VEHICLE IN)

We will pass the surveyor a copy of the GIA report during the survey.

Date of Accident: 11/06/2023

Our client's vehicle: SLJ5849R

Your Insured vehicle: SMY7739X



Warm regards,

Bel

Blk 176 Sin Ming Drive
#04-09 Sin Ming Autocare
Singapore 575721

Tel:64515752



