Rajes (LKK Auto)

From: Motor Claims (Allianz Insurance Singapore) <claims@allianz.com.sg>
Sent: Saturday, 10 June 2023 2:04 PM
To: Admin A; WORKSHOP CLAIMS
Cc: admin-d
Subject: FW: PRI Arrangement for SMM 2122 X
Internal

Your ref: SMM 2122 X
Our ref: 2023 32008838KC-GBE9499K

Dear Sirs,

We hereby appoint our direct settlement partners LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD to conduct survey.
Kindly engage with them to arrange for survey.

Shanelle @ 9187 8064 RS GARAGE SERVICES PTE. LTD.

File: SMM2122X(TP).pdf, GBE9499K Ol.pdf

Link: https://filexchange.allianz.de/SecureDownload.aspx?id=4d1ae8b5-274f-4552-blef-b3a7f239ff70-1e2dd1d1c6e8a819

Size: ~ 1 MByte, Download available until: 6/15/2023

Thank you.

Best regards,

Shanti. R

Claims Service

Allianz Insurance Singapore Pte. Ltd. | UEN 201903913C
79 Robinson Road #09-01 | Singapore 068897

Phone: +65 6395 3836 | www.allianz.sg
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This e-mail and any files transmitted with it is intended only for the named recipients and may contain confidential and /
or privileged information. If you are not the intended recipient, please do not read, copy, use or disclose the contents of
this communication to others and notify the sender immediately. Then please delete the e-mail and any copies of it.
Thank you.

Please consider the environment before printing this e-mail.

From: WORKSHOP CLAIMS <enquiry.rsg@gmail.com>

Sent: Friday, 9 June 2023 3:40 pm

To: Motor Claims (Allianz Insurance Singapore) <claims@allianz.com.sg>
Subject: [EXT] PRI Arrangement for SMM 2122 X



Dear All,

Kindly arrange PRI to survey the said vehicle as follows:

Our Client —SMM 2122 X

Your Insured — GBE 9499 K

DOA - 25/05/2023

Take note :

We will engaged our own independent surveyor for this case. Please arrange your surveyor to survey accordingly.
Regards,

Shanelle
9187 8064

RS GARAGE SERVICES PTE. LTD.

GARAGE PTE LTD



