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Meng Yan (LKK Auto)

From: Ang, Jeannie <jeannie.ang@sg.gaig.com> on behalf of Motor Claims <motorclaims@sg.gaig.com>
Sent: Friday, 9 June 2023 9:54 am
To: Motor Claims; 'Derek Oh'; admin-d; SUR; assignments
Cc: 'claimstatusenquiry'
Subject: Our ref: CLMOMVP000001344 Direct Settlement (SM) - Accident Involving SJW3511H & SMZ1504R - DOA 07/06/2023 ( Vehicle 

GROUNDED )

Hi all, 
 
Resend with claim ref no. 
 

Please note that this email is on "Without Prejudice", and should not be construed as an admission of liability.  

For all first claim notifications on Property & Casualty Claims (excluding Motor claims), please email to GeneralClaims@sg.gaig.com 
 
For work injury compensation act (WICA) claims,  please email to wicaclaims@sg.gaig.com 
 
For motor claims enquiries, please email to motorclaims@sg.gaig.com 
 
For all first claim notifications on Marine Claims, please email to marineclaims@sg.gaig.com 
 
Regards 
Jeannie Ang, Executive, Claims | P: +65 6804 7846 | jeannie.ang@sg.gaig.com 

 

 

Division | 3 Temasek Avenue #16-01 Centennial Tower Singapore 039190 
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From: Ang, 
Jeannie On 
Behalf Of Motor 
Claims 
Sent: 09 June 

2023 9:53 AM 
To: Derek Oh <Derek.Oh@inchcape.com.sg>; admin-d@lkkauto.com; sur@lkkauto.com; assignments@lkkauto.com 
Cc: claimstatusenquiry <claimstatusenquiry@borneomotors.com.sg> 
Subject: RE: Direct Settlement (SM) - Accident Involving SJW3511H & SMZ1504R - DOA 07/06/2023 ( Vehicle GROUNDED ) 
 
Without Prejudice 
 
Hi Derek, 
 
Noted on your request. 
 
 
 
Aside to LKK, 

Please accept assignment for TP survey.  

Thank you. 
 

Please note that this email is on "Without Prejudice", and should not be construed as an admission of liability.  

For all first claim notifications on Property & Casualty Claims (excluding Motor claims), please email to GeneralClaims@sg.gaig.com 
 
For work injury compensation act (WICA) claims,  please email to wicaclaims@sg.gaig.com 
 
For motor claims enquiries, please email to motorclaims@sg.gaig.com 
 
For all first claim notifications on Marine Claims, please email to marineclaims@sg.gaig.com 
 
Regards 
Jeannie Ang, Executive, Claims | P: +65 6804 7846 | jeannie.ang@sg.gaig.com 

  

 

A+ (Superior) 
 

Moody's 
A1 (Good) 

 

Standard & Poor's 
A+ (Strong) 
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From: Derek Oh 

<Derek.Oh@inchcape.com.sg>  
Sent: 09 June 2023 9:44 AM 
To: Motor Claims <motorclaims@sg.gaig.com> 
Cc: claimstatusenquiry <claimstatusenquiry@borneomotors.com.sg> 
Subject: [External] RE: Direct Settlement (SM) - Accident Involving SJW3511H & SMZ1504R - DOA 07/06/2023 ( Vehicle GROUNDED ) 
 
Hi Jeannie, We choose LKK Auto Consultants, kindly arrange today as vehicl e’s in. Tha nk you & Regards, Derek Oh TPR Tea m, Clai ms De pt E: derek. oh@ i nchcape. com.  sg From: Ang, Jeannie <jea nnie. a ng@ sg. gaig.  com> On Be half Of M otor Claims  
 

Hi Jeannie, 
 
We choose LKK Auto Consultants, kindly arrange today as vehicle’s in. 
 
Thank you & Regards, 
Derek Oh 
TPR Team, Claims Dept 
E: derek.oh@inchcape.com.sg  
 
From: Ang, Jeannie <jeannie.ang@sg.gaig.com> On Behalf Of Motor Claims 
Sent: Friday, June 9, 2023 9:26 AM 
To: Derek Oh <Derek.Oh@inchcape.com.sg>; Sam San Joi UBI <SanJoi.Sam@borneomotors.com.sg> 
Cc: claimstatusenquiry <claimstatusenquiry@borneomotors.com.sg> 
Subject: RE: Direct Settlement (SM) - Accident Involving SJW3511H & SMZ1504R - DOA 07/06/2023 ( Vehicle GROUNDED ) 
 

 

Division | 3 Temasek Avenue #16-01 Centennial Tower Singapore 039190 
 

 

  

 

A+ (Superior) 
 

Moody's 
A1 (Good) 

 

Standard & Poor's 
A+ (Strong) 
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CAUTION: This email originated from outside of the organization (Inchcape). Do not click links or open attachments unless you recognise the sender and know 
the content is safe. 

Without Prej udice Dear Sirs, We append the following list of our pa nel surveyors : - 1 . AJAX Adjusters & Surveyor s Pte Ltd 2 . A-PAC Adj usters & Surveyors Pte. Ltd. 3. Pri ority Services 4. RT Appraisal Pte Ltd 5. LKK Aut o Consultants Kindly  
 

Without Prejudice 

Dear Sirs, 

We append the following list of our panel surveyors:- 

1.       AJAX Adjusters & Surveyors Pte Ltd 

2.       A-PAC Adjusters & Surveyors Pte. Ltd. 

3.       Priority Services 

4.       RT Appraisal Pte Ltd 

5.       LKK Auto Consultants  

Kindly let us know which SJE is selected for the survey to be carried out. 

Please note that this email is on "Without Prejudice", and should not be construed as an admission of liability.  

For all first claim notifications on Property & Casualty Claims (excluding Motor claims), please email to GeneralClaims@sg.gaig.com 
  
For work injury compensation act (WICA) claims,  please email to wicaclaims@sg.gaig.com 
  
For motor claims enquiries, please email to motorclaims@sg.gaig.com 
  
For all first claim notifications on Marine Claims, please email to marineclaims@sg.gaig.com 
  
Regards 
Jeannie Ang, Executive, Claims | P: +65 6804 7846 | jeannie.ang@sg.gaig.com 
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From: Derek Oh 

<Derek.Oh@inchcape.com.sg>  
Sent: 08 June 2023 6:34 PM 
To: Motor Claims <motorclaims@sg.gaig.com>; kelvyna.ngian@sg.gaig.com 
Cc: claimstatusenquiry <claimstatusenquiry@borneomotors.com.sg> 
Subject: [External] Direct Settlement (SM) - Accident Involving SJW3511H & SMZ1504R - DOA 07/06/2023 ( Vehicle GROUNDED ) 
  
Hi, Refere nce to the above -mentioned. Plea se fi nd attache d herei n a copy of our clie nt's Accident Re port, Da maged P hotos & Esti mate Invoice for your kind per usal. As our client is claiming against your insur ed SMZ150 4R thus woul d appre ciate  
Hi,  
  
Reference to the above-mentioned.  
 
Please find attached herein a copy of our client's Accident Report, Damaged Photos & Estimate Invoice for your kind perusal.  

As our client is claiming against your insured SMZ1504R thus would appreciate if you could revert to us on the liability urgently or we could settle the case under 
Direct Settlement with Car Rental of @ $100 per day x no. of days as recommended by your appointed surveyor.  
 
Kindly have your surveyor to contact our Motor Claim Assessor, Sam San Joi @ 9847 6209 or 6631 1687 is located at 17 Ubi Road 4 for an appointment to 
inspect our client’s vehicle (currently vehicle IN in workshop).  
  
As for liability clearance, kindly revert to this email.  
  
Your kind attention into the above is greatly appreciated. 
  
Thank you & Regards, 
Derek Oh 

 

Division | 3 Temasek Avenue #16-01 Centennial Tower Singapore 039190 
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TPR Team, Claims Dept 
E: derek.oh@inchcape.com.sg  
  

This email transmission, including any attachments, is intended solely for the addressee named above, and may contain confidential or privileged information. If you are not the intended recipient, be aware that any disclosure, copying, 
distribution or use of the contents of this e-mail is prohibited. If you have received this e-mail in error, please notify the sender immediately by reply email and destroy the message and its attachments.  

This email transmission, including any attachments, is intended solely for the addressee named above, and may contain confidential or privileged information. If you are not the intended recipient, be aware that any disclosure, copying, 
distribution or use of the contents of this e-mail is prohibited. If you have received this e-mail in error, please notify the sender immediately by reply email and destroy the message and its attachments.  


