Rajes (LKK Auto)

From: Jacqueline Tan <jacqueline.tan@sg.cntaiping.com>

Sent: Wednesday, 7 June 2023 12:45 PM

To: SL LAW PRS; SUR; assignments

Cc: Cecilia Lee

Subject: RE: OUR REF: SNM22D208897/C02/GBF2376R/TANCHC &

SNM22D208958/C03/GBH9527Y/LEEPG - YOUR REF: PIPD.193140/LH ( TPP & TP,
DRIVER OF SKA4013B)

WITHOUT PREJUDICE
SAVE AS TO COST

Dear Lheny,
We will assign LKK to conduct the Re-inspection.
Dear LKK,

Please arrange to conduct the RI.

Date: 15 June 2023

Time: 9.00 am

Workshop: MJE Motor

Address: Blk 7 Sin Ming Industrial Estate Sector C #01-94 Singapore 575642

Contact Person: Hazel (98350232)

Thank you.

Regards,

Jacqueline Tawv

Senior Executive

Claims Department

China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd.

3 Anson Road #15-00 Springleaf Tower Singapore 079909

DID: (65) 6389 6185 | Tel: (65) 6389 6116 | F:(65) 6224 7175

From: SL LAW PRS <prs@sllaw.com.sg>

Sent: Wednesday, June 7, 2023 12:14 PM

To: Jacqueline Tan <jacqueline.tan@sg.cntaiping.com>

Cc: Cecilia Lee <cecilia.lee@sg.cntaiping.com>

Subject: RE: OUR REF: SNM22D208897/C02/GBF2376R/TANCHC & SNM22D208958/C03/GBH9527Y/LEEPG - YOUR
REF: PIPD.193140/LH ( TPP & TPI, DRIVER OF SKA4013B)

CAUTION: This email originated from outside the organization. Do not click links or open attachments unless you
recognize the sender and know the content is safe.

Dear Jacqueline,

We refer to the above matter and your offer dated 1% June 2023.
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Please be informed that our client is not agreeable on our offer.

Please be informed that our client’s vehicle is available for re-inspection on the below details:

Date: 15 June 2023

Time: 9.00 am

Workshop: MJE Motor

Address: Blk 7 Sin Ming Industrial Estate Sector C #01-94 Singapore 575642

Contact Person: Hazel (98350232)

Please let us have your confirmation. Thank you.

Thank you.

Regards

Lheny

Legal Secretary

DID: 6909 9356  Fax: 6909 6246

Address: 133 New Bridge Road #13 — 01 Chinatown Point, Singapore 059413

| S L LAW CHAMBERS

This e-mail is intended solely for the person to whom it has been addressed. It may contain confidential and/or legally privileged information. If you
are not the person for whom this e-mail was intended, or if this e-mail has reached you by mistake, please delete it immediately and inform us of
the error. Internet communications may not be entirely secure or accurate as information could be intercepted, corrupted, lost, arrive late or contain
viruses. Therefore, we do not accept liability for any errors or omissions in the content of this message which may arise as a result of Internet
transmission.

From: Jacqueline Tan <jacqueline.tan@sg.cntaiping.com>

Sent: Thursday, June 1, 2023 4:47 PM

To: SL LAW PRS <prs@sllaw.com.sg>

Cc: Cecilia Lee <cecilia.lee@sg.cntaiping.com>

Subject: RE: OUR REF: SNM22D208897/C02/GBF2376R/TANCHC & SNM22D208958/C03/GBH9527Y/LEEPG - YOUR
REF: PIPD.193140/LH ( TPP & TPI, DRIVER OF SKA4013B)

WITHOUT PREJUDICE
SAVE AS TO COST

Dear Sir/Mdm,
We refer to the above matter.

For sake of amicable settlement, we are prepared to contribute apportionment of liability at 70% towards
your client’s Injury claim and 100% for property claim.

TPP claim offer :-



Cost of Repair : $8,000.00 (Based on LKK paper survey & PRS)

Loss of Rental : $1,080.00
Survey fee : $987.00
Total : $10,067.00

TPI claim offer :-

General Damages : $1,500.00
Medical Expenses : $94.60
GIA / LTA / Police Search Fee(s) : $65.20
Medical Report Fee : $162.00
Costs & Disbursements : $1,605.00
Total : $3,426.80

CNTP (SNM22D208897/C02/GBF2376R/TANCHC)@ 70% - $2,398.76
CNTP (SNM22D208958/C03/GBH9527Y/LEEPG) @ 30% - $1,028.04

Please let us hear from you favorably.
However, if the repair cost cannot be agreed upon, we would like to request for re-inspection.
Please hold hands while negotiation is in progress.

Your acceptance of our offer constitutes a binding agreement in full and final settlement of your claim.
Upon receiving our payment via clearance of cheque, or electronic payment, you agree that this payment
is made without admission of liability on the part of China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd and/or
our insured(s) and you also agree absolutely to discharge China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd
and/or our insured(s) from all claims past, present and future in respect of all loss, injuries or damages
sustained by your client arising from the accident mentioned in this email.

Regards,

Jacqueline Tawv

Senior Executive

Claims Department

China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd.

3 Anson Road #15-00 Springleaf Tower Singapore 079909
Tel: (65) 6389 6116 | F:(65) 6224 7175

From: Claims Dept of CTI

Sent: Monday, April 10, 2023 11:40 AM

To: 'SL LAW PRS' <prs@sllaw.com.sg>; Jacqueline Tan <jacqueline.tan@sg.cntaiping.com>

Subject: OUR REF: SNM22D208897/C02/GBF2376R/TANCHC & YOUR REF: PIPD.193140/LH ( TPP & TPI, DRIVER OF
SKA4013B) LOD ACKNOWLEDGEMENT

WITHOUT PREJUDICE
via EMAIL ONLY

Dear Sir / Madam

We acknowledge receiving letter of demand dated 3" April 2023 with enclosures on 3" April 2023.



Please be assured that your claim is receiving our attention. We will contact you should we require additional information
or other documents relating to the claim.

Kindly take note that this acknowledgement should not be construed as an admission of liability.

Please contact our claims department Jacqueline Tan 6389 6185 the officer in charge or 6389 6116 should you require
our assistance or clarification.

*Kindly quote our claim reference number when replying.*

Thank you

Angie Foo
Claims Department

China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd.
3 Anson Road #15-00 Springleaf Tower Singapore 079909
DID: (65) 63896116 | F: (65) 62247175

W: www.sg.cntaiping.com | FB: www.facebook.com/chinataipingsg/ | WeChat: X Jjfit# Taiping SG

Disclaimer: This e-mail and any files transmitted with it is intended only for the named recipients and may contain
confidential information. Any unauthorized disclosure, use or dissemination of this message, either in whole or
partial, is prohibited. If you are not the intended recipient, please notify the sender immediately. Please delete the
e-mail and any copies of it thereafter.



