Huey Yon (LKKAuto)

From: Huey Yon (LKKAuto)

Sent: Monday, 19 June 2023 10:51 AM

To: Seah, Andy

Cc: Seah, Ted; Work Shop Estimate (SG); Lim, Stewart; SUR

Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSIGNMENT FOR 07/06/2023

Attachments: LKKPhotos.pdf; Mark estimate.pdf; PARF_COE Rebate Enquiry.pdf; SIL 3451E-IA. pdf
Dear Andy,

Enclosed herewith preliminary advice of SJL 3451E.

Best Regards,

Huey Yon | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants

phone: 6256-3561 | email: hueyyon@Ikkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Meng Yan (LKK Auto) <mengyan@lkkauto.com>

Sent: Thursday, June 8, 2023 10:32 AM

To: Seah, Andy <Seah.Andy@libertyinsurance.com.sg>; assignments <assignments@lkkauto.com>; SUR
<sur@Ilkkauto.com>

Cc: Seah, Ted <seah.ted@libertyinsurance.com.sg>; Work Shop Estimate (SG)
<workshopestimate@libertyinsurance.com.sg>

Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSIGNMENT FOR 07/06/2023

Dear Andy,

Survey was done.

Best Regards,

Yan | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6741-8434 / Whatsapp call: 87813698 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Seah, Andy <Seah.Andy®@Ilibertyinsurance.com.sg>

Sent: Thursday, June 8, 2023 9:50 AM

To: assignments <assignments@lkkauto.com>; admin-d <admin-d@lkkauto.com>; SUR <sur@|kkauto.com>
Cc: Seah, Ted <seah.ted@libertyinsurance.com.sg>; Work Shop Estimate (SG)
<workshopestimate@libertyinsurance.com.sg>

Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSIGNMENT FOR 07/06/2023

Dear Lkk

Is the vehicle inspected?



{EXTERNAL} Re: AVS23/1781-PRS-GK - Motor Insurance claim - SJL3451 E & SLJ5426C

OME Motor <omemotorpteltd@gmail.com>
To Woark Shop Estimate (SG)
Cc @ Seah, Andy;, © A/L Valiganu @ Balan, Ghobi Kaundar
!:D‘r’ou replied to this message on 08-Jun-23 .48 AM.
Hi Ghobi,
Can i know any update for the site survey?
Thanks & regards,
Cindy

OME Motor Pte Ltd

On Tue, Jun 6, 2023 at 3:31 PM Work Shop Estimate (SG) <workshopestimate @libertyinsurance.com.sg> wrote:

Hi Andy

Please schedule for survey

Regards

Workshop Estimate

Thanks

Best Regards
ANDY SEAH
Claim Department

Liberty Insurance Pte Ltd
51 Club Street #03-00 Liberty House
Singapore 069428

e "

PROUD PARTHER

From: Seah, Andy
Sent: Tuesday, June 6, 2023 5:51 PM



To: assignments@lkkauto.com; 'Yan (LKK Auto)' <admin-d@lkkauto.com>; 'SUR' <sur@Ikkauto.com>
Cc: Seah, Ted <seah.ted@libertyinsurance.com.sg>; Work Shop Estimate (SG)
<workshopestimate@libertyinsurance.com.sg>

Subject: SURVEY ASSIGNMENT FOR 07/06/2023

Dear Celine and Yan

Kindly assist to Survey the following vehicle mentioned below.

LKK Au

S/N Workshop Address Conta
1 | 18 Car Auto Services 1 Bukit Batok Crescent WCEGA Plaza #09-19 83983771 Al

2 | OME Motor 50 Bukit Batok Street 23 #01-12 Midview Building Mike 8685 4.

Thanks.

Best Regards,
Andy Seah

Claim Department

Liberty Insurance Pte Ltd

51 Club Street #03-00 Liberty House
Singapore 069428

DID: (65) 63280767
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