Bin Abdul Karim, Kaharudin

From: Infiniti CN <infinitiappraisal.cn@gmail.com>

Sent: Friday, 14 October 2022 9:53 AM

To: Bin Abdul Karim, Kaharudin

Subject: {EXTERNAL} Re: Infiniti check MV: SJL9262U / DOA: 10/10/2022
Dear Sir,

MV is ard $12k

Best regards,

Cedric Ng

Infiniti Appraisal Service
Tel : 9393 9090

Fax : 6458 7432

On Fri, 14 Oct 2022 at 09:01, Bin Abdul Karim, Kaharudin <ak.kaharudin@Ilibertyinsurance.com.sg> wrote:

Dear Edward and Cedric,

Kindly assist and advise vehicle MV, Honda Fit 1.3G (A).

Thank you.

Best regards,

Kaharudin
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