EzLyna (LKKAuto)

From: muihong@ahlimmotor.com.sg

Sent: Monday, 10 July 2023 5:19 PM

To: EzLyna (LKKAuto); Admin A; Motor Claim - Allianz

Cc: zila@ahlimmotor.com.sg

Subject: FW: Skt2100X withdraw of claim for accident with Alliance Insured - GBG3892L DOA:

31/05/2023 *** LKK REF: CC4/AIS23005665/ya3

Dear Ezlyna,

Please see below email from our client informing us that they would like to withdraw claim from our workshop as they
are not agreeable to the 50% offer .

They will seek assistance via their own workshop instead.
Please update your records accordingly.

Thank You !

Best Regards,

Kee Mui Hong

Ah Lim Motor Company

10, Ang Mo Kio Industrial Park 2A

#01-09 AMK Autopoint

Singapore 5680487
Tel : 64831244 Fax : 64836170

From: kaiyao131012@gmail.com <kaiyao131012@gmail.com>
Sent: Monday, 10 July 2023 5:02 pm

To: muihong@ahlimmotor.com.sg

Subject: Skt2100X withdraw of claim

Hi mui hong
As shared we will like to withdraw the claim, thanks

Thank you.

Sent from my iPhone



