Mei Kwan (LKKAuto)

From: Rajes (LKK Auto)

Sent: Thursday, 1 June 2023 4:28 PM

To: Motor Claims (Allianz Insurance Singapore); Admin A

Cc: assignments

Subject: RE: RE: [A/V UNSCANNABLE]RE: Accident Involving SLQ9653A/ SMR2600G on 26 May

2023. At The U-Turn Of Dunearn Road to Bukit Timah Road Near Royal Green Condo.

Dear Shanti,

Thank you for the assignment.
Repairer arrange survey on 05/06/2023.

Best Regards,
Rajes | Admin
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6741-8434 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Motor Claims (Allianz Insurance Singapore) <claims@allianz.com.sg>

Sent: Thursday, June 1, 2023 3:53 PM

To: Admin A <admin-a@Ikkauto.com>

Cc: admin-d <admin-d@Ikkauto.com>; jerry@satsg.sg

Subject: FW: RE: [A/V UNSCANNABLE]RE: Accident Involving SLQ9653A/ SMR2600G on 26 May 2023. At The U-Turn Of
Dunearn Road to Bukit Timah Road Near Royal Green Condo.

Internal

Your Ref: SLQ9653A
Our Ref: SMR2600G
Dear Sirs,
We hereby appoint our direct settlement partners LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd to conduct survey.
Kindly engage with them to arrange for survey.
M/s SAT (SG) PTE LTD
8 Kaki Bukit Avenue 4
#03-41/42 Premier @ Kaki Bukit

Singapore 415875

Please request your assessor to contact Mr Jerry Wong of SAT (SG) PTE LTD at mobile no. 8339 2339

File: PS.pdf, SLQ9653A(TP).pdf

Link: https://filexchange.allianz.de/SecureDownload.aspx?id=a6fcdclb-71a5-42a6-9551-cffb675bd199-06cleb4blabffb51

Size: ~ 1 MByte, Download available until: 6/6/2023



Thank you.

Best regards,

Shanti. R

Claims Service

Allianz Insurance Singapore Pte. Ltd. | UEN 201903913C
79 Robinson Road #09-01 | Singapore 068897

Phone: +65 6395 3836 | www.allianz.sg

QQL | Altianz @) |

This e-mail and any files transmitted with it is intended only for the named recipients and may contain confidential and /
or privileged information. If you are not the intended recipient, please do not read, copy, use or disclose the contents of
this communication to others and notify the sender immediately. Then please delete the e-mail and any copies of it.
Thank you.

Please consider the environment before printing this e-mail.

From: jerry@satsg.sg <jerry@satsg.sg>

Sent: Thursday, 1 June 2023 3:24 pm

To: Motor Claims (Allianz Insurance Singapore) <claims@allianz.com.sg>

Cc: justina@satsg.sg; john@dreamselection.net

Subject: [EXT] RE: [A/V UNSCANNABLE]RE: Accident Involving SLQ9653A/ SMR2600G on 26 May 2023. At The U-Turn Of
Dunearn Road to Bukit Timah Road Near Royal Green Condo.

Hi,
LKK
Password SLQ9653A0110J

Rgds,
Jerry

From: Motor Claims (Allianz Insurance Singapore) <claims@allianz.com.sg>

Sent: Tuesday, May 30, 2023 7:05 PM

To: jerry@satsg.sg

Subject: FW: [A/V UNSCANNABLE]RE: Accident Involving SLQ9653A/ SMR2600G on 26 May 2023. At The U-Turn Of
Dunearn Road to Bukit Timah Road Near Royal Green Condo.

Internal

Your Ref: SLQ9653A
Our Ref: SMR2600G

Dear Sirs

Enclosed is the list of surveyors for your consideration for Single Joint Expert (SJE):-



e AJAX Inspection Services Pte Ltd
e Form Team Consultancy Pte Ltd
e LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

e RT APPRIASAL PTE LTD

Please let us know who you are agreeable to appoint from the list.
Kindly provide us the Password
Best regards,

Shanti

Claims & Performance Management Department
Allianz Insurance Singapore Pte. Ltd. | UEN 201903913C
79 Robinson Road #09-01 Singapore 068897

www.allianz.sg

OQP | Altianz @ |

Please note: This e-mail and any files transmitted with it is intended only for the named recipients and may contain confidential and
/ or privileged information. If you are not the intended recipient, please do not read, copy, use or disclose the contents of this
communication to others and notify the sender immediately. Then please delete the e-mail and any copies of it. Thank you.

Please consider the environment before printing this e-mail.

From: jerry@satsg.sg <jerry@satsg.sg>

Sent: Monday, 29 May 2023 2:57 pm

To: Motor Claims (Allianz Insurance Singapore) <claims@allianz.com.sg>

Cc: justina@satsg.sg; john@dreamselection.net

Subject: [EXT] [A/V UNSCANNABLE]RE: Accident Involving SLQ9653A/ SMR2600G on 26 May 2023. At The U-Turn Of
Dunearn Road to Bukit Timah Road Near Royal Green Condo.

Warning: This email contains an unscanned attachment. You should not open attachments or click on links unless you
recognize the sender, expect the email and know the content is safe.

Dear Shanti,
Please refer to attachment (GIA Report & LTA Search)

Rgds,
Jerry Wong

From: Motor Claims (Allianz Insurance Singapore) <claims@allianz.com.sg>

Sent: Monday, May 29, 2023 2:44 PM

To: jerry@satsg.sg

Subject: FW: Accident Involving SLQ9653A/ SMR2600G on 26 May 2023. At The U-Turn Of Dunearn Road to Bukit Timah
Road Near Royal Green Condo.




Internal
Dear Sir/Madam
Kindly provide us your client's GIA report and the LTA search.

Thank you.

Should you require any clarification or assistance, please do not hesitate to contact our Claims Department at
claims@allianz.com.sg

Best regards,

Shanti. R

Claims Service

Allianz Insurance Singapore Pte. Ltd. | UEN 201903913C
79 Robinson Road #09-01 | Singapore 068897

Phone: +65 6395 3836 | www.allianz.sg

OQ | Altianz @ |

This e-mail and any files transmitted with it is intended only for the named recipients and may contain confidential and /
or privileged information. If you are not the intended recipient, please do not read, copy, use or disclose the contents of
this communication to others and notify the sender immediately. Then please delete the e-mail and any copies of it.
Thank you.

From: jerry@satsg.sg <jerry@satsg.sg>

Sent: Monday, 29 May 2023 1:39 pm

To: Motor Claims (Allianz Insurance Singapore) <Claims@allianz.com.sg>

Cc: justina@satsg.sg; john@dreamselection.net; meemee@satsg.sg; Sheryl@dreamsg.sg

Subject: [EXT] Accident Involving SLQ9653A/ SMR2600G on 26 May 2023. At The U-Turn Of Dunearn Road to Bukit
Timah Road Near Royal Green Condo.

Your Ref: SMR2600G
Our Ref: S12023-05-04- SLQ9653A

Dear Office In — Charge,

We Act for Mr Roger Li the driver of SLQ9653A which was involved in the above captioned accident. We are instructed
by our client that the accident was caused by the negligence of the driver of motor vehicle no. SMR2600G.

Our search show that you are insurers of the motor vehicle no. SMR2600G. We are putting effort in align with the
insurers to direct settle save as to cost. Please Kindly send us the list of your preferred Surveyor.

We are pleased to inform your that our client’s vehicle is available for pre-repair inspection at the following address:

M/s SAT (SG) PTE LTD



8 Kaki Bukit Avenue 4
#03-41/42 Premier @ Kaki Bukit
Singapore 415875

Please request your assessor to contact Mr Jerry Wong of SAT (SG) PTE LTD at mobile no. 8339 2339 within forty-eight
(48) hours from the receipt of this fax arrange for the inspection.



