EzLyna (LKKAuto)

From: EzLyna (LKKAuto)

Sent: Friday, 7 July 2023 10:57 am

To: kennychan@alanutd.com

Cc: Admin A

Subject: RE: REJECT CLAIM / CHECKING LIABILITY FOR T. P. CLAIM SMN4523D (CHINA) OURS
SLQ9404C ACCIDENT ON 17-05-2023 *** LKK REF: CC4/AIS23003514/Rpa3

Attachments: Ol Video Footage.mp4

Without Prejudice
Dear Kenny,
We refer to the above matter.

We have obtained vide footage from our insured. Based on the video footage, your client overtaking from behind and
made an abrupt left turn without checking clearance of traffic and caused collision.

We have our principal’s instruction to reject your client’s claim against our insured. Thank you.

With warmest regards,
Ezlyna

From: EzLyna (LKKAuto)

Sent: Wednesday, June 21, 2023 5:18 PM

To: kennychan@alanutd.com

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@Ilkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: CHECKING LIABILITY FOR T. P. CLAIM SMN4523D (CHINA) OURS SLQ9404C ACCIDENT ON 17-05-2023 ***
LKK REF: CC4/AIS23003514/Rpa3

Dear Kenny,

We refer to your email below. We still pending instruction from our principal. Have sent a chaser to them to revert
urgently.

Thank you.

With warmest regards,
Ezlyna

From: kennychan@alanutd.com <kennychan@alanutd.com>

Sent: Monday, June 19, 2023 11:16 AM

To: EzLyna (LKKAuto) <ezlyna@Ikkauto.com>

Subject: FW: CHECKING LIABILITY FOR T. P. CLAIM SMN4523D (CHINA) OURS SLQ9404C ACCIDENT ON 17-05-2023 ***
LKK REF: CC4/AIS23003514/Rpa3

Hi Ezlyna



Please update us status of your insurance pending ,kindly reply thank you .

Regards

Kenny

Alan’s United Auto Pte Ltd
64538686

From: EzLyna (LKKAuto) [mailto:ezlyna@Ikkauto.com]

Sent: Tuesday, June 13, 2023 11:44 AM

To: kennychan@alanutd.com

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@Ikkauto.com>

Subject: RE: CHECKING LIABILITY FOR T. P. CLAIM SMN4523D (CHINA) OURS SLQ9404C ACCIDENT ON 17-05-2023 ***
LKK REF: CC4/AIS23003514/Rpa3

Dear Kenny,
We refer to your email below.
We are pending instruction from our principal. Will revert upon receipt the same. Thank you.

With warmest regards,
Ezlyna

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@Ikkauto.com>

Sent: Monday, June 12, 2023 4:53 PM

To: kennychan@alanutd.com; EzLyna (LKKAuto) <ezlyna@Ikkauto.com>

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: CHECKING LIABILITY FOR T. P. CLAIM SMN4523D (CHINA) OURS SLQ9404C ACCIDENT ON 17-05-2023 #** LKK
REF: CC4/A1S23003514/Rpa3

Without Prejudice

Dear Sirs,

We will check and get back.
Hi Lyna,

Please assist.



Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742-3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com |

HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 |
S5(408933)

From: kennychan@alanutd.com <kennychan@alanutd.com>

Sent: Monday, June 12, 2023 11:31 AM

To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>

Subject: FW: CHECKING LIABILITY FOR T. P. CLAIM SMN4523D (CHINA) OURS SLQ9404C ACCIDENT ON 17-05-2023 »*x LKK
REF: CC4/A1S23003514/Rpa3

Hi Hsiao Tong
Please check & update us liability status thank you .

Regards

Kenny

Alan’'s United Auto Pte Ltd
64538686

From: kennychan@alanutd.com [mailto:kennychan@alanutd.com]

Sent: Monday, June 05, 2023 3:09 PM

To: 'Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)' <chewht@lkkauto.com>

Cc: 'shijie@alanutd.com’ <shijie@alanutd.com>

Subject: FW: CHECKING LIABILITY FOR T. P. CLAIM SMN4523D (CHINA) OURS SLQ9404C ACCIDENT ON 17-05-2023 »*x LKK
REF: CC4/A1S23003514/Rpa3

Hi Hsiao Tong
Please check liability ,thank you .

Regards

Kenny

Alan’s United Auto Pte Ltd
64538686

From: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) [mailto:Meikwan@lkkauto.com]

Sent: Monday, June 05, 2023 2:25 PM

To: kennychan@alanutd.com

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@I|kkauto.com>
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Subject: RE: CHECKING LIABILITY FOR T. P. CLAIM SMN4523D (CHINA) OURS SLQ9404C ACCIDENT ON 17-05-2023 #*+ LKK
REF: CC4/A1S23003514/Rpa3

Dear Sir / Madam,
We refer to the above matter.

Please be informed that OI has reported. Please refer to the below OI's sketch plan and statement.
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Brief Details
was lravelling stranght along Lor Chuan towards Serangoon Garden when a car lrom behind tned 1
overtake from the nght, angd even attempled 1o make a last minute left tutn into Chuan Walk. This resulie
in @ collision between the left portion of his vehicle and my right fiont poivon of my vohicle. We
exchanged particulars and left the scene. | sought medical attention thercatier and was given live day

mechcal leave | was adwvised lo lodoe an accident repon on this s
video fool age

ard matter. | have a

Please provide us the following.
e evidence i.e. video and scene photo (if any)
e PIR result (if any)

Please note that for liability, claim negotiation and settlement, please contact Hsiao Tong.
To check availability of the case handler, you may contact the undersigned.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Mei Kwan | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6366 0055 | email: MeiKwan@lkkauto.com

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: kennychan@alanutd.com <kennychan@alanutd.com>

Sent: Monday, June 5, 2023 10:32 AM

To: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>

Subject: CHECKING LIABILITY FOR T. P. CLAIM SMN4523D (CHINA) OURS SLQ9404C ACCIDENT ON 17-05-2023




Dear Person In-Charge

Please check the above t. p. claim your principle insured vehicle SMN4523D liability for direct settle ,our client vehicle
SLQ9404C accident on 17-05-2023 thank you .

Regards

Kenny

Alan’s United Auto Pte Ltd
64538686



