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Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: Admin AP Automotive Services <mota@apautomotive.services>
Sent: Monday, 12 June 2023 2:48 PM
To: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)
Cc: Taufikh (LKKAuto); SUR; CS A Team; Marcus Teo; paul; jack teo; info; ClickUp: SBT 

6988G
Subject: Re: REQUEST FINALISED FOR SBT 6988G INFINITI Q50 2.0T DOA 28.05.2023

Dear Veron, 
 
We accepted the COR offer of $1,150.00 and 2 repair days. 
 
We will submit the LOD accordingly. 
 
Thank you. 
 
Best Regards 
 
Zaleha  
Motor Claims Manager 

AP Automotive Services Pte Ltd 
 
 
 

 

(65) 6970 4786 | (65) 9329 4240 

 

mota@apautomotive.services 

 

www.apautosg.com 

 

56 Loyang Way #04-04 Loyang Enterprise Building S508775 | UEN:202022890H
  

 
 
On Mon, 12 Jun 2023 at 11:46, Veron Chen (LKKAuto) <veronchen@lkkauto.com> wrote: 
Dear Zaleha, 
  
  

 “Without Prejudice”  

  

We will be advising our Principal a cost of repair of LS $1150/- with 2 days of repair, subject to their approval.  
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Best Regards, 

Veron Chen | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

  

  

From: Taufikh (LKKAuto) <Taufikh@lkkauto.com>  
Sent: Thursday, June 8, 2023 5:06 PM 
To: SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>; CS A Team <cs-a@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: FW: REQUEST FINALISED FOR SBT 6988G INFINITI Q50 2.0T DOA 28.05.2023 

  

  

From: Admin AP Automotive Services <mota@apautomotive.services> 
Sent: Thursday, 8 June 2023 5:05:28 pm (UTC+08:00) Kuala Lumpur, Singapore 
To: Taufikh (LKKAuto) <Taufikh@lkkauto.com>; Veron Chen (LKKAuto) <veronchen@lkkauto.com> 
Cc: Marcus Teo <marcus@apautosg.com>; paul <paul@apautosg.com>; jack teo <teoyinpingjack@gmail.com>; 
info <info@apautosg.com>; ClickUp: SBT 6988G <a.c.865cekf66.u-37601221.ed7c4aaf-6d51-4734-a0a5-
7f42172661aa@tasks.clickup.com> 
Subject: REQUEST FINALISED FOR SBT 6988G INFINITI Q50 2.0T DOA 28.05.2023 

Dear Taufikh,  

  

Attached after paint photos as requested 

  

We seek your kind help if you could finalize the vehicle. 

  

Looking forward to hear from you soon. 

  

No Vehicle Number Make / Model DOA Estimate Finalised Surveyor 
              

1 SBT 6988G  INFINITI Q50 2.0T   28.05.2023   $4,935.14   $1,750.00   TAUFIKH 
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Please do not hesitate to contact me should you have any queries thereof. 

 

Thank you. 

  

Best Regards 

  

Zaleha  
Motor Claims Manager 
AP Automotive Services Pte Ltd 
 
 
 

  

 

(65) 6970 4786 | (65) 9329 4240 

 

mota@apautomotive.services 

 

www.apautosg.com 

 

56 Loyang Way #04-04 Loyang Enterprise Building S508775 | UEN:202022890H

  

  

  


