Celine Fong (LKKAuto)

From: Meng Yan (LKK Auto)

Sent: Tuesday, 11 July 2023 10:28 AM

To: Rajes

Cc: Muhammad Hazdi Bin Hasni; Sheikh Eusoff; SUR; assignments; Insurance Admin;
Sarjeet Singh; Vithyanagan Pandian; Bryan Ang (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: Appointment of SJE // MC/MC 3918/2021 // C Yogarajah Ref :

CY.11330.21.JLA.(PD-HW).wp.rj// KCP Ref: SS/sm/2021000709 Sompo(mpd)

Dear Sir / Madam,

Please be informed that physical re-inspection needed for this case.
Kindly arrange re-inspection appointment once it is available.

Our operation hour : Monday — Friday @ 9.00am — 6.00pm

Thank you.

Best Regards,
Yan | Admin
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Litd

Phone: 6741-8434 / Whatsapp call: 87813698 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Rajes <rajes@yoga-legal.com>

Sent: Monday, July 10, 2023 6:01 PM

To: Meng Yan (LKK Auto) <mengyan@Ikkauto.com>

Cc: Muhammad Hazdi Bin Hasni <hazdi.hasni@kcpartnership.com>; Sheikh Eusoff <eusoff@yoga-legal.com>; SUR
<sur@lkkauto.com>; assignments <assignments@lkkauto.com>; Insurance Admin
<insurance.admin@kcpartnership.com>; Sarjeet Singh <sarjeet.singh@kcpartnership.com>; Vithyanagan Pandian
<vithyanagan.pandian@kcpartnership.com>; Bryan Ang (LKKAuto) <bryanang@Ikkauto.com>

Subject: Re: Appointment of SJE // MC/MC 3918/2021 // C Yogarajah Ref : CY.11330.21.JLA.(PD-HW).wp.rj// KCP
Ref: SS/sm/2021000709 Sompo(mpd)

Dear Sirs,

We refer to your email of 8th June 2023.

We have just been informed that our client is currently overseas and will be back in August 2023.
Please confirm if a paper survey can be conducted instead.

Thank you.

On Thu, Jun 8, 2023 at 12:30 PM Meng Yan (LKK Auto) <mengyan@Ikkauto.com> wrote:

Dear Rajes,



Please be informed that our operation hours is MON-FRI @ 9AM-6PM.

Kindly re-arrange the appointment. Thank you.

Best Regards,
Yan | Admin
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6741-8434 / Whatsapp call: 87813698 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Rajes <rajes@yoga-legal.com>

Sent: Thursday, June 8, 2023 11:09 AM

To: Meng Yan (LKK Auto) <mengyan@lkkauto.com>

Cc: Muhammad Hazdi Bin Hasni <hazdi.hasni@kcpartnership.com>; Sheikh Eusoff <eusoff@yoga-legal.com>; SUR
<sur@Ilkkauto.com>; assignments <assignments@lkkauto.com>; Insurance Admin
<insurance.admin@kcpartnership.com>; Sarjeet Singh <sarjeet.singh@kcpartnership.com>; Vithyanagan Pandian
<vithyanagan.pandian@kcpartnership.com>; Bryan Ang (LKKAuto) <bryanang@Ikkauto.com>

Subject: Re: Appointment of SJE // MC/MC 3918/2021 // C Yogarajah Ref : CY.11330.21.JLA.(PD-HW).wp.rj// KCP
Ref: SS/sm/2021000709 Sompo(mpd)

Dear Sirs,

We refer to your email of 31st May 2023.

Our client's vehicle No SKV 5713Y can be inspected at the following :-

Date : 24.6.2023 (Saturday)



Time : 11.00 a.m.

Location : JL Auto Services Pte Ltd

Blk 3006 Ubi Road 1

#01-346

Singapore 408700

Tel : 91885495 (Mr Ah Tay)

On Wed, May 31, 2023 at 2:22 PM Meng Yan (LKK Auto) <mengyan@Ikkauto.com> wrote:

Dear Hazdi,

The fees as mentioned as below (exclusive of 8% GST).

Please be informed that we would like to conduct as Re-inspection.

Dear M/S C Yogarajah LLC,

Please provide full set of TP SR and colour photograph.

Please let us know 3-5 days in advance for the re-inspection.

Date :

Time :

Location :



Contact person :

Thank you.

Best Regards,
Yan | Admin
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6741-8434 / Whatsapp call: 87813698 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Muhammad Hazdi Bin Hasni <hazdi.hasni@kcpartnership.com>

Sent: Tuesday, May 30, 2023 3:11 PM

To: Meng Yan (LKK Auto) <mengyan@Ikkauto.com>; Bryan Ang (LKKAuto) <bryanang@Ikkauto.com>; rajes@yoga-
legal.com; Sheikh Eusoff <eusoff@yoga-legal.com>; SUR <sur@Ikkauto.com>; assignments
<assignments@lkkauto.com>

Cc: Insurance Admin <insurance.admin@kcpartnership.com>; Sarjeet Singh <sarjeet.singh@kcpartnership.com>;
Vithyanagan Pandian <vithyanagan.pandian@kcpartnership.com>; hazdi.hasni@kcpartnership.com

Subject: RE: Appointment of SIE // MC/MC 3918/2021 // C Yogarajah Ref : CY.11330.21.JLA.(PD-HW).wp.rj// KCP
Ref: SS/sm/2021000709 Sompo(mpd)

Importance: High

Email sent for and on behalf of Mr Sarjeet Singh, Kelvin Chia Partnership

Dear Meng Yan,

We refer to your email of even date appended below.

Thank you for the acknowledgement.



Please liaise with M/s C Yogarajah LLC (copied herein) for any other documents and arrange for a
physical re-inspection (if required) of SKV 5713Y and thereafter prepare an SJE report to record your
findings.

Separately, we would be grateful if you could kindly confirm that Mr Bryan Ang'’s fees are as follows:

Paper Survey - $300.00

Physical Re-inspection - 5$400.00
Court Attendance Expert Witness Fee:
(a) State Courts

i) Half day: $300.00

ii) Full day: $600.00

”

All above charges are subject to GST 7%.

Thank you.

Kind regards,

Muhammad Hazdi (Mr.)

Paralegal. Any legal advice is rendered by the Partner, on whose behalf this email is issued.

Note: We have adopted a telecommuting policy for our department. In the circumstances, kindly direct all
communications to us via email with immediate effect.

Lawyers Paralegal Secretaries
sarjeet.singh@kcpartnership.com vithyanagan.pandian@kcpartnership.com chong.ruth@kcpartnership.con

6408 7990 6408 7927 6408 7872
cynthia.lee@kcpartnership.com hazdi.hasni@kcpartnership.com

6408 7936 6408 7958
angeline.rajoo@kcpartnership.com

6408 7925



LEGAL
PARTMNERS
ACROSS
ASIA

PARTNERSHIP

Kelvin Chia Partnership Telephone: (65) 6220 1911
1 Harbourfront Ave. #14-01 Facsimile: (65) 6224 4118
Keppel Bay Tower Direct dial: (65) 6408 7958
Singapore 098632 Website: kcpartnership.com

Singapore Ho Chi Minh City Phnom Penh
Bangkok Jakarta Shanghai
Hanoi Mandalay Yangon

CONFIDENTIALITY CAUTION:

This message is intended only for the use of the individual/entity to whom it is addressed and may
contain information that is privileged and confidential. If you are not the intended recipient of this
message, you should not disseminate, distribute or copy this communication. If you have received
this communication in error, please notify the writer immediately by return e-mail and delete the
original message. Thank you.

From: Meng Yan (LKK Auto) <mengyan@lkkauto.com>

Sent: Tuesday, May 30, 2023 2:49 PM

To: Muhammad Hazdi Bin Hasni <hazdi.hasni@kcpartnership.com>; Bryan Ang (LKKAuto)
<bryanang@lkkauto.com>; rajes@yoga-legal.com; Sheikh Eusoff <eusoff@yoga-legal.com>; SUR
<sur@Ikkauto.com>; assignments <assignments@|kkauto.com>

Cc: Insurance Admin <insurance.admin@kcpartnership.com>; Sarjeet Singh <sarjeet.singh@kcpartnership.com>;
Vithyanagan Pandian <vithyanagan.pandian@kcpartnership.com>

Subject: RE: Appointment of SIE // MC/MC 3918/2021 // C Yogarajah Ref : CY.11330.21.JLA.(PD-HW).wp.rj// KCP
Ref: SS/sm/2021000709 Sompo(mpd)

Dear Hazdi,

Thank you for the assignment.



Best Regards,
Yan | Admin
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6741-8434 / Whatsapp call: 87813698 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Muhammad Hazdi Bin Hasni <hazdi.hasni@kcpartnership.com>

Sent: Monday, May 29, 2023 5:53 PM

To: Bryan Ang (LKKAuto) <bryanang@Ikkauto.com>; rajes@yoga-legal.com; Sheikh Eusoff <eusoff @yoga-
legal.com>; admin-d <admin-d@lkkauto.com>

Cc: Insurance Admin <insurance.admin@kcpartnership.com>; Sarjeet Singh <sarjeet.singh@kcpartnership.com>;
hazdi.hasni@kcpartnership.com; Vithyanagan Pandian <vithyanagan.pandian@kcpartnership.com>

Subject: Appointment of SJE // MC/MC 3918/2021 // C Yogarajah Ref : CY.11330.21.JLA.(PD-HW).wp.rj// KCP Ref:
SS/sm/2021000709 Sompo(mpd)

Importance: High

Email sent for and on behalf of Mr Sarjeet Singh, Kelvin Chia Partnership

Attention Mr Bryan Ang

MC/MC 3918/2021

Dear Sirs,

We refer to the above matter.

M/s C Yogarajah LLC (copied herein) act for the Plaintiff (Owner of SKV 5713Y) and we act for the 1%
and 2" Defendant (Owner and Driver of GBC 3401S).

Please be informed that the Court has appointed you, Mr Bryan Ang, as the Single Join Expert (“SJE”)
for this matter.



We enclose herewith copies of the following documents for your attention, kindly access the documents
via dropbox link:

https://www.dropbox.com/scl/fo/gj17pkelpxtgk4g50Ipbz/h?dI=0&rlkey=lejsxvi29pspyvzdjwbyolzx0

Singapore Accident Statement of SKV 5713Y dated 28 December 2020 (with coloured
photographs);

Singapore Accident Statement of GBC 3401S dated 13 January 2021 (with coloured
photographs);

Priority Services Paper survey report dated 22" April 2021

Priority Services Pre repair survey dated 16" January 2021 (with coloured Photographs)

KTO Automobile Assessors Vehicle Inspection Report dated 5" February 2021

Please liaise with M/s C Yogarajah LLC (copied herein) for any other documents and arrange for a
physical re-inspection (if required) of SKV 5713Y and thereafter prepare an SJE report to record your
findings.

Note that we have inadvertently omitted to write to you with regards to the appointment. For your
reference, we attached herein the Order of Court dated 3 April 2022.

In lieu of your appointment, kindly let us have the SJE Report of Motor vehicle no. SKV 5713Y
urgently.

Kindly confirm that Mr Bryan Ang'’s fees are as follows:

Paper Survey - $300.00
Physical Re-inspection - $400.00

Court Attendance Expert Witness Fee:



(a) State Courts
i) Half day: $300.00
ii) Full day: $600.00

All above charges are subject to GST 7%.”

Kindly bill the full fees to Kelvin Chia Partnership.

Kindly acknowledge receipt of the assignment.

Thank you.

Kind regards,

Muhammad Hazdi (Mr.)

Paralegal. Any legal advice is rendered by the Partner, on whose behalf this email is issued.

Note: We have adopted a telecommuting policy for our department. In the circumstances, kindly direct all
communications to us via email with immediate effect.

Lawyers Paralegal Secretaries
sarjeet.singh@kcpartnership.com vithyanagan.pandian@kcpartnership.com chong.ruth@kcpartnership.con

6408 7990 6408 7927 6408 7872
cynthia.lee@kcpartnership.com hazdi.hasni@kcpartnership.com

6408 7936 6408 7958
angeline.rajoo@kcpartnership.com

6408 7925



LEGAL
PARTNERS
ACROSS
ASIA

PARTNERSHIP

Kelvin Chia Partnership Telephone: (65) 6220 1911
1 Harbourfront Ave. #14-01 Facsimile: (65) 6224 4118
Keppel Bay Tower Direct dial: (65) 6408 7958
Singapore 098632 Website: kcpartnership.com

Singapore Ho Chi Minh City Phnom Penh
Bangkok Jakarta Shanghai
Hanoi Mandalay Yangon

CONFIDENTIALITY CAUTION:

This message is intended only for the use of the individual/entity to whom it is addressed and may
contain information that is privileged and confidential. If you are not the intended recipient of this
message, you should not disseminate, distribute or copy this communication. If you have received
this communication in error, please notify the writer immediately by return e-mail and delete the
original message. Thank you.

Note: In view of the current Covid-19 situation, we have adopted a telecommuting policy for our office. In
the circumstances, kindly direct all communications to us via email with immediate effect.

Regards

Ms. Rajes (Secretary)

M/s C. YOGARAJAH LLC

162, Bishan Street 13

#01-186

Singapore 570162

Tel/Fax : (65) 65020372

(UEN No0.201333127N) (GST Reg N0.201333127N)

Important Note: This electronic mail transmission (including any attachments) is private and confidential
and may contain legally privileged information. If you are not the intended recipient, you may not use, copy
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or disseminate the information contained herein. Please delete this message and its attachments
immediately and contact us at (65) 65020372, if you have received this message in error. Thank you.

Note: In view of the current Covid-19 situation, we have adopted a telecommuting policy for our office. In the
circumstances, kindly direct all communications to us via email with immediate effect.

Regards
Ms. Rajes (Secretary)

M/s C. YOGARAJAH LLC

162, Bishan Street 13

#01-186

Singapore 570162

Tel/Fax : (65) 65020372

(UEN No0.201333127N) (GST Reg N0.201333127N)

Important Note: This electronic mail transmission (including any attachments) is private and confidential and
may contain legally privileged information. If you are not the intended recipient, you may not use, copy or
disseminate the information contained herein. Please delete this message and its attachments immediately
and contact us at (65) 65020372, if you have received this message in error. Thank you.
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