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Huey Yon (LKKAuto)

From: Lynn Yap (Ding Auto) <Claims@dingauto.sg>

Sent: Friday, 23 June 2023 10:15 AM

To: Kenneth Kong (LKKAuto)

Cc: Huey Yon (LKKAuto); Kenneth Ding; Edmund Choy (Ding Auto); Henry Lee (Ding 

Auto); Celine Chua (Ding Auto)

Subject: Re: III I OD CLAIM - SLT8052A I REF : D22MFL008943 - FINALIZE REPAIR

Dear Kenneth, 
 
We are agreeable to your offer. 
Kindly assist us to upload your offer in Merimen so that we can upload our DV & tax invoice for payment 
processing, thank you. 
 

Best Regards, 
 

To help protect your privacy, Microsoft Office prevented 
automatic download of this picture from the Internet.

  

Lynn Yap  
Claims Department 

 
Mobile +65 9385 8368  Office +65 6452 1208  
Web www.dingauto.sg  Email claims@dingauto.sg  
HQ  176 Sin Ming Drive #04-06 Sin Ming Autocare S575721  
Branch  Blk 10 Sin Ming Industrial Estate Sector C #01-20 S575645 
  

 

 

On Fri, Jun 23, 2023 at 8:16 AM Kenneth Kong (LKKAuto) <KennethKong@lkkauto.com> wrote: 

Attach finalise for SLT 8052A, please check and confirm. Final amount subject to insurance approval 

thanks. 

From: Lynn Yap (Ding Auto) <Claims@dingauto.sg> 

Sent: Thursday, 22 June 2023 12:59 pm 

To: Kenneth Kong (LKKAuto) <KennethKong@lkkauto.com> 

Cc: Huey Yon (LKKAuto) <hueyyon@lkkauto.com>; Kenneth Ding <kenneth.ding@dingauto.sg>; Edmund Choy (Ding 

Auto) <estimator@dingauto.sg>; Henry Lee (Ding Auto) <sa0406@dingauto.sg>; Celine Chua (Ding Auto) 

<accounts@dingauto.sg> 

Subject: Re: III I OD CLAIM - SLT8052A I REF : D22MFL008943 - FINALIZE REPAIR  

  

Dear Kenneth, 
 
We would like to check and follow up on the finalize offer. 
Kindly assist us to expedite the finalize offer as soon as possible, thank you. 
 

Best Regards, 
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To help protect your privacy, Microsoft Office prevented 
automatic download of this picture from the Internet.

  

Lynn Yap  
Claims Department 

 
Mobile +65 9385 8368  Office +65 6452 1208  
Web www.dingauto.sg  Email claims@dingauto.sg  
HQ  176 Sin Ming Drive #04-06 Sin Ming Autocare S575721  
Branch  Blk 10 Sin Ming Industrial Estate Sector C #01-20 S575645 
  

 

 

On Mon, Jun 12, 2023 at 2:54 PM Henry Lee (Ding Auto) <sa0406@dingauto.sg> wrote: 

Dear Kenneth, 
 

Good day to you. 

 
Kindly refer to the attached after paint photos for your review 
and  
seek your approval. 
 
We would like to finalise L/S repair as below : 
 
Parts - $8800.00 
S/N - $535.00 
Labour - $1930.00 
 
Total : $11265.00 - 20% LS = $9012.00. 
 
Repair - 07 days. 
 
Kindly assist us to expedite this finalization asap. Hope to hear  
from you soon. Thank you. 
 
 
Best Regards, 

 
To help protect your privacy, Microsoft Office prevented 
automatic download of this picture from the Internet.

  

Henry Lee  
Claims Department 

 
Mobile +65 8363 6141  |  Office +65 6452 1208  
Web www.dingauto.sg  |  Email sa0406@dingauto.sg  
HQ  176 Sin Ming Drive #04-06 Sin Ming Autocare S575721  
Branch  Blk 10 Sin Ming Industrial Estate Sector C #01-20 S575645 
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To help protect your privacy, 
Micro so ft Office prevented  
auto matic downlo ad o f this  
picture from the Internet.
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