Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Sent: Monday, 17 July 2023 3:57 PM

To: Dorlyn Li (Cheng Hoe)

Cc: Admin A

Subject: RE: ENQUIRY OF LIABILITY - SKU7103A (DOA: 25/05/2023) - AIG INSURED :

SMT5636Z *** |kk ref: CC6/AIG23005410/pa3

WITHOUT PREJUDICE
Dear Sirs,

We have reviewed the matter and we regret to infirm you that we are unable to look into your client’s claim as your
client was moving out from stationary position and hit our insured vehicle.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742-3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com |

HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 |

S(408933)

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Sent: Wednesday, June 7, 2023 9:00 AM

To: Dorlyn Li (Cheng Hoe) <chmotor@singnet.com.sg>

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@Ikkauto.com>

Subject: RE: ENQUIRY OF LIABILITY - SKU7103A (DOA: 25/05/2023) - AIG INSURED : SMT5636Z *** |kk ref:
CC6/AIG23005410/pa3

WITHOUT PREJUDICE
Dear Sirs,
Please be informed that liability is unclear.

Please provide evidence to support your client’s claim. Thanks.



Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742-3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com |

HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 |
S(408933)

From: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) <Meikwan@I|kkauto.com>

Sent: Monday, May 29, 2023 6:10 PM

To: Dorlyn Li (Cheng Hoe) <chmotor@singnet.com.sg>

Cc: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@Ikkauto.com>; Admin A <admin-a@I|kkauto.com>

Subject: RE: ENQUIRY OF LIABILITY - SKU7103A (DOA: 25/05/2023) - AIG INSURED : SMT5636Z *** Ikk ref:
CC6/AIG23005410/pa3

Dear Sir / Madam,
We refer to the above matter.

Please be informed that OI has reported. Please refer to the below OI's statement.

Describe Circumstances of the Accident

On 25/05/2023 at or about 3.25pm, | had just made a left turn from Ubi Ave 3 onto Ubi Road 1.
| then occupied the right lane of the 2-lane road of Ubi Road 1 as | had noticed a Honda Vezel
was stationary with hazard lights switched on, just outside my office located at No 53 Ubi Road 1.
The two lanes would eventually merge as one, just outside the office.

| then continued to drive at reduced speed as | had 1o make a left turn into the driveway
to my office, Just as my car passedthe stationary Honda Vezel.| made the left turn into the

driveway. with my signal indicator on.

And as | was about to complete the turn, | felt an impact from the left rear portion of my car
and-realized-that the Honda Vezel had moved off from the stationary withoutdue care. s

The female driver of the Honda Vezel came down and began to apolegize.

Please provide us the following.
e evidence i.e. video and scene photo (if any)
e PIRresult (if any)

Please note that for liability, claim negotiation and settlement, please contact Hsiao Tong.

To check availability of the case handler, you may contact the undersigned.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Mei Kwan | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6366 0055 | email: MeiKwan@Ikkauto.com




Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Dorlyn Li (Cheng Hoe) <chmotor@singnet.com.sg>

Sent: Friday, May 26, 2023 6:43 PM

To: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) <Meikwan@lkkauto.com>; Weilin (Cheng Hoe) <chmotor@singnet.com.sg>
Subject: ENQUIRY OF LIABILITY - SKU7103A (DOA: 25/05/2023) - AlG INSURED : SMT5636Z

Dear Sir/Madam,

OUR CLIENT - SKU7103A
DOA: 25/5/23 @ 1540hr
AIG INSURED : SMT5636Z

Attached our client report.

Pls advise on liability and any instruction for DIRECT SETTLEMENT?

Thank you.

Rgds,

Dorlyn Li

Cheng Hoe Motor Pte Ltd
Tel :67556142

Fax : 67557719



