Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

From: Rasul (LKKAuto)

Sent: Thursday, 27 July 2023 10:12 AM
To: Wally Tan PTCBC

Cc: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

Subject: Re: Final bill of SKR7575L

Hi Wally,

We will be advising our principal a cost of repair P/P $7,794.80 /- with 07 days of repair
before GST, subject to their approval.

Best Regards,

Rasul | Assessor

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: Rasul@lkkauto.com | fax: 6841-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

ES i Save the Earth- Frint only when necessary-

From: Wally Tan PTCBC <wally.tan@borneomotors.com.sg>
Sent: Wednesday, 26 July 2023 10:23 am

To: Rasul (LKKAuto) <Rasul@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: Final bill of SKR7575L

Hi Rasul,

Please find attached final bill of SKR7575L for your kind perusal.
Thank you

Wally



