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Celine Fong (LKKAuto)

From: Michelle Tan <michelle.tan@genie.sg>
Sent: Thursday, 25 May 2023 4:02 PM
To: Celine Fong (LKKAuto)
Cc: LKK Valuation; SUR
Subject: Re: Valuation of Used Car

Hi Celine, 
 
Please proceed to bill us for the valuation so that we can receive the official report soon. 
 
Thank you! 
 
Best Regards, 
Michelle Tan  
9818 0672 | michelle.tan@genie.sg 
20 Sin Ming Lane #05-64 Midview City Singapore 573968 
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On Thu, May 25, 2023 at 3:13 PM Celine Fong (LKKAuto) <celinefong@lkkauto.com> wrote: 

Dear Michelle, 

  

The Valuation of vehicle as below: 

  

  

SMA 6926E           MV: $66,000.00              

  

As at May 2023. 

  

  

Thank you. 
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Best Regards, 

Celine Fong  

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

phone: 6256-3561 | email: celinefong@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

  

From: Michelle Tan <michelle.tan@genie.sg>  
Sent: Thursday, May 25, 2023 12:20 PM 
To: LKK Valuation <valuation@lkkauto.com> 
Cc: SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>; Celine Fong (LKKAuto) <celinefong@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: Re: Valuation of Used Car 

  

Dear Team, 

  

Please refer to the logcard attached for desktop valuation. 

  

Thank you! 

  
Best Regards, 
Michelle Tan  
9818 0672 | michelle.tan@genie.sg 
20 Sin Ming Lane #05-64 Midview City Singapore 573968 
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On Thu, May 25, 2023 at 10:04 AM Celine Fong (LKKAuto) <celinefong@lkkauto.com> wrote: 

Dear Michelle, 

  

Thank you for the email. 
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You may send your desktop valuation request together with the log card (may need few photos for commercial 
vehicle) to our valuation email valuation@lkkauto.com. 

  

  

  

Best Regards, 

Celine Fong  

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

phone: 6256-3561 | email: celinefong@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

  

From: Michelle Tan <michelle.tan@genie.sg>  
Sent: Wednesday, May 24, 2023 1:46 PM 
To: Celine Fong (LKKAuto) <celinefong@lkkauto.com> 
Cc: SUR <sur@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: Re: Valuation of Used Car 

  

Hi Celine, 

  

We would like to go with the desktop valuation. May I know how does it work? 

  
Best Regards, 
Michelle Tan  
9818 0672 | michelle.tan@genie.sg 
20 Sin Ming Lane #05-64 Midview City Singapore 573968 
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On Mon, May 22, 2023 at 11:38 AM Celine Fong (LKKAuto) <celinefong@lkkauto.com> wrote: 



4

Dear Michelle, 

  

Thank you for your enquiry. 

  

We do provide market valuation of a used car. 

  

We are pleased to submit our Professional Fee Charges (with formal report) as follows: 

  

Desktop Valuation - $150.00   

  

On Site Valuation - $200.00  

  

  

All above charges are subject to GST 8%. 

  

  

Please contact the undersign if you need further clarification. 

  

  

  

Best Regards, 

Celine Fong  

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

phone: 6256-3561 | email: celinefong@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

  

From: Michelle Tan <michelle.tan@genie.sg>  
Sent: Friday, May 19, 2023 2:11 PM 
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To: SUR <sur@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: Valuation of Used Car 

  

Dear Team, 

  

I am writing on behalf of my company, Genie Financial Services Pte Ltd. We are seeking assistance to 
get an appraisal or valuation of a used car.  

  

May I know if your company is able to provide this service? 

  

Thank you! 

  
Best Regards, 
Michelle Tan  
9818 0672 | michelle.tan@genie.sg 
20 Sin Ming Lane #05-64 Midview City Singapore 573968 
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