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Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

From: Taufikh (LKKAuto)
Sent: Friday, 28 July 2023 12:24 AM
To: thomas@boxfresh.com.sg
Cc: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto); Huey Yon (LKKAuto)
Subject: RE: Update on final COR for SBS6516R and SBS6543L
Attachments: SBS 6543L.pdf; SBS 6516R.pdf

Hi Thomas, 
 
Please refer attached,  
 

1) SBS 6543L COR $8046.04 , 4 days. 
2) SBS 6516R COR $ 1884.40 , 2 days. 

 
Subject to insurance approval. 
 
Regards 
Taufikh 
Lkk Auto 
 
 
 

From: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) <Meikwan@lkkauto.com>  
Sent: Wednesday, June 28, 2023 4:55 PM 
To: thomas@boxfresh.com.sg; Taufikh (LKKAuto) <Taufikh@lkkauto.com> 
Cc: kmeu@boxfresh.com.sg; 'Eu carrie' <carrie@boxfresh.com.sg>; karine@boxfresh.com.sg; alex@boxfresh.com.sg; 
'tan' <tan@boxfresh.com.sg>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: RE: Update on final COR for SBS6516R and SBS6543L 
 
Dear Sir / Madam, 
  
Thank you for your email. 
  
Our respective surveyor will look into the matter and get back to you in due course. 
  
Hi Taufikh, 
  
Kindly assist.  
SBS 6543L- CS/SMR23005812/Tnp3 
SBS 6516R - CS/INC23005227/Tqp3 
 
Thank you. 

Best Regards, 

Mei Kwan | Admin  

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6366 0055 | email: MeiKwan@lkkauto.com  

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 
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From: thomas@boxfresh.com.sg <thomas@boxfresh.com.sg>  
Sent: Wednesday, June 28, 2023 3:41 PM 
To: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com> 
Cc: kmeu@boxfresh.com.sg; 'Eu carrie' <carrie@boxfresh.com.sg>; karine@boxfresh.com.sg; alex@boxfresh.com.sg; 
'tan' <tan@boxfresh.com.sg> 
Subject: Update on final COR for SBS6516R and SBS6543L 
 
To whom it may concern 
 
Will like to find out the status for finalization of COR for the 2 buses above inspected by Mohd Taufik 
 
Thanks to advise. 
 
Regards 
 
 
Thomas Hoo 
Business Development Manager 
7030 Ang Mo Kio Ave 5 #06-49 
Northstar@AMK S569880 
HP : 97898644 
 


